REGULAR MEMBERS

Marvin “Mac” McVicker - Chair
13719 Hedi Rd.

Woodland Park, CO 80863
(updated city 8/19/2020)

Jeffrey Smith — Vice Chair
1380 Rampart Range Rd.
P.O. Box 515

Woodland Park, CO 80866

Russell J. “Jeff” Canhill
187 Glen Dale Drive
Woodland Park, CO 80863

Derrick Carpenter — Vice Chair
1396 Rampart Range Rd.
Woodland Park, CO 80863

Jim Olsen
904 Stone Park Ln. #304
Woodland Park, CO 80863

ALTERNATES

Matt Cockroft
35 Spruce Dr.
Woodland Park, CO 80863

VACANT

STAFE

Sally Riley, AICP, Planning Director

David Burgess, Planning & Bldg. Tech

City of Woodland Park
Board of Review
(Revised on 12/15/2020)

H: (303) 647-2054
Valkyrie3610@hotmail.com

M: 338-0300
swinc@earthlink.net

H: 687-1849
M: 648-2974
groanerguy@aol.com

H: 687-2261
M: 439-8077
Dependable ent80@yahoo.com

M: 244-0791
jolsen@foxgal.com

M: 963-8372
W: 822-1000
Matt@ CrosswoodHomes.com

H:
M:
(email)

0: (719) 687-5283
M: (719) 510-1874
sriley@city-woodlandpark.org

O: (719) 687-5202

dburgess@city-woodlandpark.org

Appointed as
Alternate:
Appointed as

Regular member:

Re-appointed:
Re-appointed
Expires:

Appointed as
Alternate:
Appointed as

Regular Member:

Expires:

Appointed as
Alternate:
Re-appointed as
Alternate:
Expires:
Appointed as
Regular member
Re-appointed:
Expires:

Appointed:
Re-appointed:
Re-appointed:
Expires:

Appointed as
Alternate:
Appointed as

Regular member:

Expires:

Appointed:
Expires:

Appointed:
Expires:

12/5/2013

1/7/2016
1/19/2017
1/2/2020
1/1/2023

1/3/2019

10/1/2020
1/1/2023

12/5/2013

1/15/2015
1/1/2018

1/18/2018
1/2/2020
1/1/2023

12/5/2013
1/19/2017
1/2/2020
1/1/2023

8/18/2016

1/3/2019
1/1/2022

1/3/2019
1/1/2022

H:\Planning\Building Department\BOARD OF REVIEW\Members and Appointments\Board of Review Roster-2020-12-15 (REVISED).docx


mailto:Valkyrie3610@hotmail.com
file://///filestore.cityofwp.net/City%20Data/Planning/Building%20Department/BOARD%20OF%20REVIEW/Members%20and%20Appointments/swinc@earthlink.net
mailto:groanerguy@aol.com
mailto:Dependable_ent80@yahoo.com
mailto:Matt@CrosswoodHomes.com
mailto:sriley@city-woodlandpark.org
file://///filestore.cityofwp.net/City%20Data/Planning/Building%20Department/BOARD%20OF%20REVIEW/Members%20and%20Appointments/dburgess@city-woodlandpark.org

BOARD OF REVIEW

CITY OF WOODLAND PARK

2021 CALENDAR OF MEETINGS AND DEADLINES

MEETING DATES @ 3:30 PM
(3 Thursday monthly unless
noted *)

APPLICATION DEADLINE
(14 days prior to meeting unless
noted *)

Email PACKETS DISTRIBUTED
(Friday prior to meeting
unless noted *)

Thursday, January 21, 2021

Thursday, January 7, 2021

Friday, January 15, 2021

Thursday, February 18, 2021

Thursday, February 4, 2021

Friday, February 12, 2021

Thursday, March 18, 2021

Thursday, March 4, 2021

Friday, March 12, 2021

Thursday, April 15, 2021

Thursday, April 1, 2021

Friday, April 9, 2021

Thursday, May 20, 2021

Thursday, May 6, 2021

Friday, May 14, 2021

Thursday, June 17, 2021

Thursday, June 3, 2021

Friday, June 11, 2021

Thursday, July 15, 2021

Thursday, July 1, 2021

Friday, July 9, 2021

Thursday, August 19, 2021

Thursday, August 5, 2021

Friday, August 13, 2021

Thursday, September 16, 2021

Thursday, September 2, 2021

Friday, September 10, 2021

Thursday, October 21, 2021

Thursday, October 7, 2021

Friday, October 15, 2021

Thursday, November 18, 2021

Thursday, November 4, 2021

Friday, November 12, 2021

Thursday, December 16, 2021

Thursday, December 2, 2021

Friday, December 10, 2021

* = Adjusted date due to a holiday.

"H:\Planning\Building Department\Board of Review\Meeting Schedule\BOR Schedule of Meetings & Deadlines 2021.docx"




ELEVATE
o

—

L/‘:
‘ 4

WOODLAND

CITY ABOVE THE CLOUDS

BOARD OF REVIEW
CITY OF WOODLAND PARK, BUILDING DEPARTMENT
CITY HALL COUNCIL CHAMBERS
220 W. SOUTH AVENUE, WOODLAND PARK, CO
THURSDAY APRIL 15, 2021 - 3:30 P.M.
AGENDA

This meeting is a hybrid in-person & Zoom meeting. The Zoom meeting link is in the calendar
at the bottom of the City website (www.city-woodlandpark.orqg) — click the “View All” button
since this is a truncated list for April and may not appear on the homepage. Please call the

Planning & Building Department at (719) 687-5202 with questions or comments.

VI.

VII.

VIII.

XI.

CALL TO ORDER AND ROLL CALL

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

ELECTION OF OFFICERS

APPROVAL OF MEETING MINUTES - August 8, 2020

CONSENT ITEMS — None

COMPLAINTS - None

VARIANCE OR APPEALS HEARINGS - None

UNFINISHED BUSINESS — None

NEW BUSINESS -

A. Request to recommend approval of an ordinance by City Council to adopt Pikes
Peak Regional Building Code, 2017, 2" Printing, to accommodate timely adoption
of the Colorado State Electrical Code and the Colorado State Plumbing Code.

DISCUSSION OR COMMENT

ADJOURNMENT


http://www.city-woodlandpark.org/

VI.

VII.

WOODLAND PARK BOARD OF REVIEW
MEETING MINUTES
City Hall Council Chambers
Regular Meeting on August 20, 2020
3:30 PM

Due to the COVID-19 pandemic, this meeting was a hybrid in-person and virtual electronic meeting. A
Zoom® link for participation was posted on the front-page of the City website. Public input in the form of
written comment submitted in advance of the meeting was strongly encouraged and accommodation for
public comment in real time at the meeting was made.

CALL TO ORDER AND ROLL CALL: Chairman Mac McVicker was physically present, and called
the meeting to order at approximately 3:38 p.m. Also physically present were Vice-Chair Derrick
Carpenter, and Alternate Jeff Smith. Board members Jeff Cahill and Jim Olsen attended via Zoom®
virtual video. Alternate member Matt Cockroft was absent. The City’s Planning & Building Technician
David Burgess was physically present, and the Pikes Peak Regional Building Department (PPRBD)
Construction Inspector Timothy Steinwinder attended via Zoom®.

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE: Chairman McVicker led the Pledge of Allegiance.

ELECTION OF OFFICERS: Derrick Carpenter nominated Mac McVicker for Chairman, and Jeff
Smith seconded. Mac McVicker was elected unopposed to Chairman of the Board of Review. Since there
Is a vacancy for a Regular Member, and with Jeff Smith’s consent, Chairman McVicker motioned that
Jeff Smith be moved to the open Regular Member position, and Derrick Carpenter seconded. Motion
passed unopposed. Derrick Carpenter nominated Jeff Smith for Vice-Chair, and Chairman McVicker
seconded. Jeff Smith was elected unopposed to the Vice-Chair position. These positions are valid until
December 31, 2020.
NOTES:
a) Jim Olsen’s votes could not be registered, due to lack of audio from him. This was remedied by
Mr. Olsen prior to the case hearing.
b) It was determined by Staff after adjournment that Jeff Smith would be required to be appointed to
the Board as a Regular Member by the City Council. This appointment took place on October 1,
2020.

APPROVAL OF MEETING MINUTES - OCTOBER 17, 2019: It was moved by Derrick Carpenter
and seconded by Jeff Smith to approve the minutes as presented. The motion to approve the minutes
passed unanimously. Jeff Cahill noted that the issued Agenda had the wrong year noted (2020), although
the date on the actual meeting minutes were correct.

CONSENT ITEMS: None.
COMPLAINTS: None.

VARIANCE OR APPEAL HEARINGS:

A. VAR2020-02(B) — 2600 Vista Glen Court, PPRBD Permit #M33030 — Jeff Smith, Member and
Contractor’s License holder with Master Roofing Co., LLC requests a variance to the 2015 IRC
Section R905.1 to allow for an exception of installation of metal roofing eave closure.

Jeff Smith recused himself from the hearing, since he is the case applicant. After brief discussion, it
was determined that the reference code section should be “R905.10 Metal roof panels”. Mr.

Page 1 of 3



Steinwinder stated that the code references manufacturer’s installation instructions regarding the foam
eave closure.

Mr. Smith stated that the instructions are 47 pages in length. They show where the eave closure is to
be installed, if the contractor chooses to install them. There is no notations in these instructions as to
whether they are recommended or required. He discussed this with the manufacturer’s representative,
Bill Daniel of Metal Sales Manufacturing Corporation. Mr. Daniel explained that the eave closure is
not specified in the instructions as recommended or required, because its use is optional. Mr. Smith
stated he does not install these in Teller County. He said that small wildlife will chew and remove
them, and when this does not happen, normal seasonal temperature expansion and contraction causes
them to eventually fall out on their own. These pieces then get into the roof gutters, plugging the
gutters and downspouts. For this reason, he stopped installing these components 15 years ago. He has
never had any issue by not installing them, and this is the first time he has failed an inspection for not
installing them, including all the metal roofs he has installed in Teller County and El Paso County.

Mr. Burgess stated that he had earlier distributed a letter to the Board from the Teller County
Community Development Services Division, and suggested Chairman McVicker read the letter into
the record, since some of the meeting’s participants were not physically present to receive the letter.
Chairman McVicker read the letter, dated August 20, 2020. The letter states that Teller County
enforces minimum code requirements and defers to the manufacturer’s installation instructions for all
products. If the foam closures are not required or recommended by the manufacturer, they are not
required by Teller County. The letter was signed by Roger K. Campbell, Building Official.

Chairman McVicker said that he checked with Summit County, which has a higher average elevation
than Teller County. This is the county that the towns of Frisco and Breckenridge are located. They do
not require the closures. Mr. Smith stated he has installed metal roofing in Summit County without
any inspection issues. Chairman McVicker said that he went to the manufacturer’s website, and that
he could not find where the closures are required.

Jeff Cahill stated he understood why Mr. Smith does not install them, given the problem with the small
wildlife. He also understands that the roof deck is still protected with the required underlayment, and
that he does not see the need for this ancillary closure.

Jim Olsen asked what the opposition is to using the closures. Mr. Smith reiterated the nuisance it
creates. Mr. Olsen added that as someone who sells this type of metal roofing product, he rarely has
requests for this component.

Chairman McVicker asked Tim Steinwinder what caused this to be an issue for this particular roofing
permit. Mr. Steinwinder explained that he is the PPRBD Construction Inspector for this area. PPRBD
has dedicated roofing inspectors, and that the roofing inspector assigned to this project was the
individual who made this finding. He said that he personally does roof inspections occasionally, and
that he would have not made the same call. He is mostly concerned with proper underlayment
protecting the wood panels. He does not believe the closure is necessary in this case. He asked if
anyone spoke with the Tom Nolan, the PPRBD Senior Roofing Inspector, since there are occasions
that Mr. Nolan can administratively resolve roofing matters. Mr. Smith said he did discuss this with
Mr. Nolan, without resolve. Mr. Steinwinder stated that as the PPRBD representative for this case, he
has no objection to not installing the closure. Mr. Burgess asked Mr. Steinwinder to follow up with
PPRBD administrators so that there is clear direction on these closures in the future, which Mr.
Steinwinder agreed to do.

Page 2 of 3



VIII.

XI.

MOTION: Made by Jeff Cahill that the Board of Review approve the variance request as discussed.
Seconded by Jim Olsen. Motion passed unanimously.

UNFINISHED BUSINESS: None.

NEW BUSINESS: None.

DISCUSSION OR COMMENT: Mr. Burgess noted that he had distributed the Planning and Building
Department monthly report for July, and that despite the ramifications of the COVID pandemic, the City
is on track to meet or exceed last year’s overall numbers. Chairman McVicker welcomed Mr. Steinwinder

as the latest PPRBD Construction Inspector assigned to the City.

ADJOURNMENT: Chairman McVicker adjourned the meeting at approximately 4:10 p.m. by
unanimous voice consent.

Recorded by:

David J. Burgess, Planning & Building Technician

Approved this day of , 2021

Mac McVicker, Chair

Page 3 of 3



A
s

FPikes Peak

Building Department

2880 International Circle Colorado Springs, Colorado 80910
Telephone (719) 327-2994
Email Address: roger@pprbhd.org

Web address — www.pprbd.org

March 9, 2021

CERTIFIED MAIL, RETURN RECEIPT REQUESTED

The Honorable Hilary LaBarre

Mayor Pro-Tem, City of Woodland Park
220 W. South Avenue

P.O. Box 9007

Woodland Park, CO 80866

RE:  Request to Adopt Pikes Peak Regional Building Code, 2017 Edition, 2™ Printing,
to Accommodate Timely Adoption of the Colorado State Electrical Code /
Colorado State Plumbing Code

Dear Mayor Pro-Tem LaBarre:

The purpose of this communication is to notify you that in accordance with Sections 12-
20-204, 12-115-107(2)(a), and 24-4-103, Colorado Revised Statutes (C.R.S.), the State of
Colorado Electrical Board formally adopted the 2020 edition of the National Electrical Code
(NEC) as the State Electrical Code with an effective date of August 1, 2020. Further, the State of

Colorado Plumbing Board adopted the 2018 edition of the International Plumbing Code (IPC), as
amended, on June 14, 2020.

Under authority granted by the State of Colorado, local jurisdictions (and in this case,
specifically Pikes Peak Regional Building Department) may and do(es) administer the State
Electrical Code and State Plumbing Code as an agent of the State.

C.R.S. §§ 12-115-107(2)(j) and (k) require an incorporated town, city, or county to adopt
and enforce the State Electrical Code within twelve (12) months of adoption by the State Electrical
Board. C.R.S §§ 12-155-105(1)(I) and (m) require an incorporated town, city, or county to adopt
and enforce the State Plumbing Code within twelve (12) months of adoption by the State Plumbing
Board.



The Honorable Hilary LaBarre
March 9, 2021
Page 2 of 3

In accordance with State of Colorado requirements and the Pikes Peak Regional Building

Code, 2017 Edition, as amended, Pikes Peak Regional Building Department will adopt and
enforce:

e the State of Colorado Electrical Code effective as of July 31, 2021; and
e the State of Colorado Plumbing Code effective as of June 13, 2021.

As aresult, adoption of the Pikes Peak Regional Building Code, 2017 Edition, 2" Printing,
is requested of the City of Woodland Park by the Department specific for the adoption of the
above-referenced, State required codes. The Pikes Peak Regional Building Code, 2017 Edition,
2" Printing, contains the following provision:

Each Jurisdiction has the final authority regarding proposed Code content prior to
adoption. The Code becomes enforceable when each Jurisdiction legally adopts the
Code by resolution or ordinance. Notwithstanding, amendments or revisions to any
regulations, standards, codes, studies, Flood Insurance Rate Maps (FIRM), or Flood
Insurance Study (FIS) reports, adopted in the Code by reference, as promulgated
by the federal government or the State of Colorado, or by any agency of either of
them, are adopted by reference, as if fully set forth herein, without further action

by each Jurisdiction and declared to be a part of the adopting resolution or
ordinance.

See, the Pikes Peak Regional Building Code, 2017 Edition, as amended, Preface, available at
https://www.pprbd.org/File/Resources/Downloads/Codes/2017%20PPRBCY%20V | .0%202nd%?2

OPrintingFINAL3protected.pdf.

The Pikes Peak Regional Building Code, 2017 Edition, 2" Printing, as containing the
above-referenced provision, has been adopted by all other jurisdictions serviced by the
Department, including, the City of Colorado Springs, the City of Fountain, the City of Manitou
Springs, the Town of Monument, the Town of Palmer Lake, the Town of Green Mountain Falls,
and El Paso County.

You may inspect all jurisdictions’ adopting resolution(s) or ordinance(s) of the Pikes Peak
Regional Building Code, 2017 Edition, 2nd Printing, at

https://www.pprbd.ore/Information/CodeChanges.

For purposes of the requested adoption of the Pikes Peak Regional Building Code, 2017
Edition, 2 Printing, the attorney for the Department, Ms. Virjinia V. Koultchitzka, has prepared
the enclosed, draft ordinance for review and consideration. Ms. Koultchitzka is available to work
with you and staff, as needed, to revise and finalize the ordinance. It is our understanding that Mr.
Jason Myers is no longer the Town Attorney; as a result, the Department is happy and willing to

assist prepare whatever additional legal documents may be needed for purposes of the requested
and needed adoption.

Please contact me at your earliest convenience to discuss this matter and required
scheduling(s) before the City Council of the City of Woodland Park.

C:\Users\linda.DOMRBD\AppData\Local\Microsoft\Windows\INetCache\Content.Outlook\AE5F20C5\2 | 03 09
Mayor Pro-Tem Hilary LaBarre.docx



The Honorable Hilary LaBarre
March 9, 2021
Page 3 of 3

I look forward to hearing from you.

Pikes Peak Regional Building Department

By:
Roger N. Lovell
Building Official

Enclosures

cc: Michael Lawson
Acting City Manager
220 W. South Avenue
P.O. Box 9007
Woodland Park, CO 80866

Sally Riley, AICP
Planning Director

220 W. South Avenue
P.O. Box 9007

Woodland Park, CO 80866

Virjinia V. Koultchitzka
Regional Building Attorney

C:\Users\linda. DOMRBD\AppData\Local\Microsoft\Windows\INetCache\Content.Outlook\AESF20C5\21 03 09
Mayor Pro-Tem Hilary LaBarre.docx



CITY OF WOODLAND PARK, COLORADO
ORDINANCE NO. , SERIES 2021

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 15.02 OF THE MUNICIPAL CODE OF THE CITY
OF WOODLAND PARK BY ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE PIKES PEAK REGIONAL
BUILDING CODE, 2017 EDITION, 2P PRINTING, WHICH ADOPTED BY REFERENCE,
CERTAIN SECONDARY CODES, CONTAINING AUTHORITY TO ADOPT
AMENDMENTS OR REVISIONS TO ANY REGULATIONS, STANDARDS, CODES,
STUDIES, FLOOD INSURANCE RATE MAPS (FIRM), OR FLOOD INSURANCE STUDY
(FIS) REPORTS, ADOPTED IN THE CODE BY REFERENCE, AS PROMULGATED BY THE
FEDERAL GOVERNMENT OR THE STATE OF COLORADO, OR BY ANY AGENCY OF
EITHER OF THEM, BY REFERENCE, AS IF FULLY SET FORTH THEREIN, WITHOUT
FURTHER ACTION BY THIS JURISDICTION AND DECLARED TO BE A PART OF THE
ADOPTING RESOLUTION OR ORDINANCE.

WHEREAS, pursuant to the Inter-governmental Agreement (IGA) between the City of
Woodland Park and Pikes Peak Regional Building Department, approved by City Council on
November 7, 2018, Pikes Peak Regional Building Department provides certain building
department services to the City of Woodland Park; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to Ordinance 1321, Series 2018, the City Council for the City of
Woodland Park adopted, by reference, the Pikes Peak Regional Building Code, 2017 Edition, 1°t
Printing (the “2017 Edition, 1% Printing of the Code™); and

WHEREAS, in accordance with Sections 12-20-204, 12-115-107(2)(a), and 24-4-103,
Colorado Revised Statutes (C.R.S.), the State of Colorado Electrical Board formally adopted the
2020 edition of the National Electrical Code (NEC) as the State Electrical Code with an effective
date of August 1, 2020. Further, the State of Colorado Plumbing Board adopted the 2018 edition
of the International Plumbing Code (IPC), as amended, on June 14, 2020; and

WHEREAS, under authority granted by the State of Colorado, local jurisdictions (and in
this case, specifically Pikes Peak Regional Building Department) may and do(es) administer the
State Electrical Code and State Plumbing Code as an agent of the State; and

WHEREAS, C.R.S. §§ 12-115-107(2)(j) and (k) require an incorporated town, city, or
county to adopt and enforce the State Electrical Code within twelve (12) months of adoption by
the State Electrical Board. Further, C.R.S §§ 12-155-105(1)(1) and (m) require an incorporated
town, city, or county to adopt and enforce the State Plumbing Code within twelve (12) months of
adoption by the State Plumbing Board; and

WHEREAS, in accordance with State of Colorado requirements and the Pikes Peak
Regional Building Code, 2017 Edition, as amended, Pikes Peak Regional Building Department
will adopt and enforce the State of Colorado Electrical Code effective as of July 31, 2021, and the
State of Colorado Plumbing Code effective as of June 13, 2021; and

WHEREAS, Pikes Peak Regional Building Department has promulgated a 2" Printing of
the Pikes Peak Regional Building Code, 2017 Edition, as amended (the “2017 Edition, 2™ Printing



of the Code”), addressing building regulations to ensure life safety and welfare of the City of
Woodland Park community through efficient and consistent application of adopted codes and
standards, and more specifically, addressing changes mandated by the State of Colorado with
regard to adoption of the 2020 edition of the National Electrical Code (NEC) as the State Electrical
Code, and the 2018 edition of the International Plumbing Code (IPC), as amended, requiring

amendments to the Preface of the Code, which, in accordance with Section 3 1-16-207, C.R.S., are
fully set forth herein; and

WHEREAS, in accordance with C.R.S. § 31-16-206, responsibility to maintain copies for
inspection by the public is hereby delegated to the Regional Building Official, and three (3) copies
of the 2017 Edition, 2" Printing of the Code, are on file and available in the office of the Regional
Building Official, Pikes Peak Regional Building Department, 2880 International Circle, Suite 100,

Colorado Springs, Colorado 80910, and may be inspected or purchased by the public during
regular business hours; and

WHEREAS, the City Council of Woodland Park finds it to be in the best interest of the

citizens to amend Chapter 15.02 of the Woodland Park Municipal Code by adopting, by reference,
the 2017 Edition, 2™ Printing of the Code.

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY OF WOODLAND PARK, COLORADO,
ORDAINS:

Section 1. Adoption of the 2017 Edition. 2™ Printing of the Code. The 2017 Edition, 2"
Printing of the Code is hereby adopted by reference and accordingly §15.02.010 of the
Municipal Code of the City of Woodland Park is hereby amended to read as follows:

15.02.010 Adoption. The Pikes Peak Regional Building Code, 2017 Edition, 2"¢
Printing, promulgated and published by the Pikes Peak Regional Building Commission,
2880 International Circle, Colorado Springs, Colorado, 80910, exclusive of Appendices A-
I, is hereby adopted by reference as set out in this codification with, however, the
amendments set forth in this Chapter and in accordance with Ordinance 1321, Series 2018.

Section 2. RBC308 Amendments. Section RBC308 of the 2017 Edition, 2™ Printing of the
Code regarding the 2015 IECC adopted by reference accordingly is hereby amended with
the addition of §15.02.155 to read as follows:

15.02.155 RBC308. The 2015 IECC and RBC308 shall be amended as follows:
A. Delete Fenestration U-Factor 0.32 from Climate Zone 5 B per Table R402.1.2
and replace with 0.35.
B. Delete “20 or 13+5” from the Wood Frame Wall R-Value column from Climate
Zone 5 B per Table R402.1.2 and replace with “19 or 15+2”; further, modify
Footnote h as follows: “15+2 means R-15 cavity insulation plus R-2 insulated
sheathing. If the building is continuously sheathed with structural panels, insulated
sheathing may be omitted.”
C. Delete IECC Section R402.4.1 and replace with the following:
R402.4.1 Building Thermal Envelope. The building thermal
envelope shall be demonstrated to comply with either section
402.4.1.1 or section 402.4.1.2.




Further, delete IECC Section R402.4.1.1 and replace with the following:
R402.4.1.1 Visual Inspection. The building thermal envelope shall
be considered acceptable when the components are installed in
accordance with the manufacturer’s instructions and the criteria
listed in table R402.4.1.1. Where required by the code official, an
approved third party shall inspect the building thermal envelope.

D. Delete IECC Section R403.5.4 regarding the drain water heat recovery units.

Section 3. Amend References. Various section references shall be amended in accordance
with the re-formatted Sections of the 2017 Edition, 2" Printing of the Code as follows:
15.02.110 Replace RBC302.4.34 with RBC302.4.40
15.02.120 Replace RBC303.4.28 with RBC302.4.29
15.02.130 Replace RBC304.4.26 with RBC304.4.16

15.02.140 Repeal this section as it is no longer relevant with the adoption of the
2017 Edition, 2" Printing of the Code.

Section 4. Conflicts. If any conflicts exist between the 2017 Edition, 27 Printing of the
Code adopted herein and the Woodland Park Municipal Code or the Woodland Park
Engineering Specifications, the latter shall take precedence.

Section 5. Savings Clause. Should any article, section, clause or provision of this
Ordinance be declared by a court of competent jurisdiction to be invalid, the same shall not
affect the validity of the balance of this Ordinance.

Section 6. Effective Date. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after
its publication as required by law.

PASSED BY CITY COUNCIL ON SECOND AND FINAL READING FOLLOWING PUBLIC
HEARING THIS DAY OF , 2021.

MAYOR or MAYOR PRO-TEM

ATTEST:

CITY CLERK



APPROVED AS TO FORM

CITY ATTORNEY



4, Code of Colorado Regulations
==#% 1 Secretary of State

%) 78y
ESZZ4Y State of Colorado
e

DEPARTMENT OF REGULATORY AGENCIES

State Electrical Board

STATE ELECTRICAL BOARD RULES AND REGULATIONS

3 CCR 7101
[Editor's Notes follow the text of the rules at the end of this CCR Document.]

1.1

1.2

STATEMENT OF BASIS AND PURPOSE

Following are the adopted changes to the Rules and Regulations of the Colorado State Electrical
Board (“the Board”) for general clarification, for efficient management and expeditious procedures
of the Board, and for the safeguarding of the general public in compliance with Title 12, Article
115, of the Colorado Revised Statutes.

The Board adopts the following Rules pursuant to the authority granted to the Board by section
12-115-107(2)(a), C.R.S., and hereby repeals all previous rules with the same number.

These Rules shall be binding on every person and legal entity authorized to practice, offer to
practice, or perform electrical or electrical contracting in Colorado. All licensees and registrants
under Title 12, Article 115 of the Colorado Revised Statutes are charged with having knowledge
of the existence of these Rules and shall be deemed to be familiar with their provisions and to
understand the rules. In these Rules, the word “licensee” shall mean any person holding a master
electrician license, journeyman electrician license, or residential wireman license. In these Rules,
the word “registrant” shall mean any person registered as an electrical apprentice and any person
or legal entity registered with the Board as an electrical contractor.

These Rules are severable. If one rule or portion of a rule is found to be invalid, all other rules or

portions of rules that can be enforced without the invalid rules shall be enforced and shall remain
valid.

STANDARDS

The Board hereby adopts the National Fire Protection Association standard number 70, hereafter
known as the National Electrical Code, 2020 Edition, and as may be amended by the Board.
These standards are adopted as the minimum standards governing the planning, laying out, and
installing or the making of additions, alterations, and repairs in the installation of wiring apparatus
and equipment for electric light, heat, and power in this state. This Rule does not include later
amendments to or editions of the National Electrical Code, 2020 Edition. The effective date shall
be August 1, 2020.

A copy of the provisions of the National Electrical Code, 2020 edition is available for public
inspection during regular business hours at the Board office at the Division of Professions and
Occupations, Department of Regulatory Agencies, 1560 Broadway, Suite 110, Denver, Colorado,
80202, and at any state publications depository library. For further information regarding how this
material can be obtained or examined, contact the Program Director for the Board (“Program
Director”) at 1560 Broadway, Suite 110, Denver, Colorado, 80202, (303) 894-2300. The National
Electric Code, 2020 Edition, is available directly from the National Fire Protection Association
(NFPA), 1 Batterymarch Park, Quincy MA 02169-7471, phone 1-800-344-3555. Copies are also
available from the NFPA website at NFPA.org, as well as most online and retail book vendors.




CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR710-1
State Electrical Board

1.3 APPRENTICE REGISTRATION AND RECORDKEEPING

A. Registration

1. The Board may require the employer of an electrical apprentice to provide information
verifying the apprentice’s record of employment and practical experience, including but
not limited to a written attestation from the responsible master electrician verifying that
the apprentice has been performing electrical work during any period the apprentice was
not registered. Employers of apprentices shall cooperate with any request from the Board

pursuant to this Rule and furnish such information or assistance as the Board may
request.

2. An individual that holds an active residential electrician’s license and is working on a
commercial job site must be registered as an apprentice.

3. An employer who fails to timely register an apprentice as required by section 12-115-

115(3)(a), C.R.S., and this Rule shall be subject to disciplinary action pursuant to section
12-115-122, C.R.S.

4, An employer who fails to remove an apprentice from their company's registration within
30 days of termination of employment shall be subject to the same disciplinary action as
Board Rule 1.3(A)(3) above.

B. Recordkeeping. Electrical Contractors shall maintain employment records or work reports for their
apprentices in order to provide experience verification. Such records or reports should accurately
document the type of work by the number of hours and months the apprentice performed
electrical work as defined by section 12-115-103, C.R.S., and should specifically reflect:

1. Exact dates of employment;
2. Number of hours and months of residential electrical experience; and,
3. Numper of hours and months of commercial, industrial, or substantially similar electrical
experience.
C. Contractors shall provide such employment records indicated in Board Rule 1.3(B) above upon

termination or resignation of an apprentice.

D. Contractors who did not provide information as indicated in Board Rule 1.3(B)(1) above, shall
provide the information upon request from any apprentice formerly employed by that contractor.

14 APPLICATION TO TEST FOR LICENSURE

A All applications for exams shall be submitted to the Division of Professions and Occupations in a
form and manner approved by the Board.

B. Experience,
1. Applicants cannot verify their own experience. |
2. General Documentation Requirements. Applicants shall provide documented written

evidence of all in state and out of state experience on experience verification forms
prepared and furnished by the Board which shall include all of the following:

a. Exact dates of employment.




CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR710-1

State Electrical Board

b. Breakdown of electrical work performed in:
(1) Commercial, residential, industrial and/or maintenance/service; and,
(2) Increments of hours and months.

C. Signature of the master electrician for, or a signatory authority of, the electrical
contractor or employer.

d. “Supervising” as used in section 12-115-110(1)(a)(ll), C.R.S., means the
supervision of registered apprentices by a licensed journeyman.

3. Maintenance Experience. Maintenance experience shall be submitted for evaluation on

experience verification forms prepared and furnished by the Board.

a.

A maximum of two years of experience credit may be granted for work performed
under the supervision, and verified by, a Colorado (or equivalent) licensed
electrician.

A maximum of one year of experience credit may be granted for work not
required to be performed under the supervision of a licensed electrician, and
verified by the employer.

4. Foreign Experience

a.

Applicants shall have one year of in-country electrical construction experience
and familiarity with the National Electrical Code.

A maximum of three years of out-of-country experience may be applied towards
credit for a journeyman license.

A maximum of four years out-of-country experience may be applied towards
credit for a master license.

Applicants who have electrical experience from a foreign country for which they
wish to receive experience credit are required to submit the documentation
accompanied by an English language translation and a certification signed by the
translator that must be printed legibly or typed. Such certification must include a
statement that the translator is competent to translate the document, and that the
translation is true and accurate to the best of the translator's abilities.

(1) This evaluation will be performed at the applicant's expense and the
applicant will be responsible for submitting all the necessary information
to the evaluating institution.

5. Calculating Years of Experience. This Rule is intended to clarify the term “years” of
experience earned as referenced in the statutes and does not negate any other
requirement set forth in the Board's Rules or statutes for requirements for licensure.

a.

When evaluating experience earned by an applicant pursuant to section 12-115-
110, C.R.S., the minimum practice experience required for examination is
calculated in “years” as follows:

(1 Residential Wireman — 4,000 hours earned in no less than two years.




CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR710-1
State Electrical Board

(2) Journeyman Electrician — 8,000 hours earned in no less than four years.
(3) Master Electrician — 10,000 hours earned in no less than five years.
C. Education
1. Community College Degree. Applicants that are graduates from an accredited community
college shall hold a degree in the electrical field to receive credit pursuant to section 12-
115-110, C.R.S.
2. Trade School
a. Apprenticeship training programs are not equivalent to trade schools.
b. A trade school shall meet the following criteria:
(1) Provide training in the following areas as it relates to the electrical trade:

(a) Maintenance and new construction wiring in residential and
commercial buildings;

(b) Basic math related to the electrical industry;

{c) Basic use of hand tools and materials;

(d) Basic electrical resistive theory, wire sizing, circuit construction,
and troubleshooting;

(e) Basic to advanced study in motor control, motor theory and
maintenance, installation and maintenance of equipment,
designing electrical systems, blueprint reading, estimating, and
electrical codes;

{f) Electrical theory and practical application; and,

(9) OSHA curriculum based safety training.

(2) Provide official transcripts noting credit hours.

(a) Graduate must obtain no less than 165 credit hours.

(b) Each credit hour shall represent no less than nineteen classroom
hours.

3. Transcripts. Applicants providing documentation of education must submit an official

transcript from the school with the application. The transcript must be provided with the
application in an official envelope sealed by the granting institution.

4, Foreign Education

a. Applicants who have an electrical engineering degree or electrical engineering
courses from foreign colleges, universities, or their equivalents for which they
wish to receive educational credit are required to have the transcripts evaluated
by an electrical engineering department in an accredited university to determine if
the curriculum is substantially equivalent.




CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR710-1
State Electrical Board

D.

Training

1.

b. This evaluation will be performed at the applicant's expense and the applicant will
be responsible for submitting all the necessary information to the evaluating
institution.

C. Applicants providing documentation of education must submit the evaluation from

the evaluating institution with the application.

Other Education Credit. Applicants for licensure with electrical apprenticeship training,
other electrical training, non-accredited electrical education, or other electrical education
not addressed in statute or Board Rules may be granted a maximum of one year of
experience credit provided the applicant meets and provides the following
documentation:

a. Course curriculum with the number of classroom hours completed; and,
b. Certification of completed hours.
C. Credit may be awarded as follows:
(1) Credit for the successful completion of non-accredited electrical courses

or program shall be credited one month of experience for two months of
schooling up to a maximum of one year.

(2) Education without a certificate of completion may replace actual field
experience under a licensed master at the rate of one month credit for
every six months training or experience up to maximum of one year.

Apprenticeship Training Requirements. Persons who, on or after January 1, 2011, either,
enter an apprenticeship program or register as an apprentice, must comply with the
following requirements. Pursuant to section 12-115-110(2)(a)(ill), C.R.S., during the last
four years of apprenticeship, an applicant for a journeyman electrician’s license shall
provide documented written evidence of at least 288 hours of electrical training
conducted in compliance with rules promulgated by the Board.

a. One hour of approved training shall consist of not less than fifty minutes of
instruction, presentation, or activity spent in structured education.

b. The 288 hours of approved training is in addition to any stipulated on-the-job
training requirement and shall include technical and professional subjects related

to the practice of electrical work which the Board deems necessary to safeguard
the public. Such subjects include:

(1) Grounding/bonding;

(2) National Electrical Code changes;
(3) Wiring methods;

(4) Theory/calculations; and,

(5) A minimum of ten and a maximum of forty hours of OSHA curricutum
based safety training.




CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR 7101

State Electrical Board

c. 288 Hours Training Criteria. To qualify for credit, training activities must be
structured educational efforts meeting all of the following criteria:

) Include technical and practical applications which impact criteria listed in
Board Rule 1.4(D)(1)(b);

(2) Be current and presented by qualified and technically competent
instructors; and,

(3) Provide certificates of completion or other documentation for the
apprentice electrician and maintain records of attendance.

d. No Pre-Approval of 288 Hours Training Activities. The Board will not pre-approve
courses or programs. It is within the discretion of the Board to deny credit for any
activity that does not meet the training criteria in Board Rule 1.4(D)(1)(c).

e. Acceptable 288 Hours Training Activities. The Board deems the following types
of activities to be acceptable. On-line delivery and participation in Board Rule
1.4(D)(1) may be acceptable if in compliance with these Rules, including but not
limited to Board Rule 1.6(D)(8).

) Not-for-credit academic course;

(2) For-credit academic course; and,

(3) Industry training programs.

f. Non-Acceptable 288 Hours Training Activities. The Board deems the following
types of activities not acceptable training for this requirement:

M Serving on federal, state, or municipal boards or commissions;

(2) Rendering pro bono services;

(3) Faculty at college, university, or other educational institution shall not
receive credit for teaching their regularly-assigned courses beyond the
initial class;

(4) Participation on a public, professional, or technical society board;

(5) Attendance at licensing or registration board meetings or any other
professionally relevant board or committee meeting; and,

(6) Participating in or attending exhibit poster sessions or trade shows.

g. Recordkeeping. The applicant shall track and document training hour

requirements in a process approved by the Board. The applicant shall retain the
documentation for a minimum of three years following completion of the activity.
Documentation shall contain, at a minimum, the following information:

(1) Apprentice electrician name;

(2) - Activity type:

(3) Activity location and date(s);




CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR710-1

State Electrical Board

(4) Activity title and description of content and objectives;

(5) Name and contact information of the sponsor or training provider (e.g.
organization, institution, association, employer, vendor, or publication);

(6) Instructor or speaker name(s), as applicable;

(7) Name and contact information of the monitor, facilitator, or mentor, as
applicable;

(8) Certificate of completion; and,
(9) Number of classroom hours.

Training earned under this requirement shall not qualify for any other education,
training, or experience credit.

E. License by Endorsement

1. Applicants may qualify for licensure by endorsement, providing that the applicant has:

a.

An active residential wireman'’s license, journeyman electrician’s license, or
master electrician’s license in another state, respective to the license the
applicant is applying for;

Successfully completed a state or federally-approved apprenticeship program, or
obtained the required years and type of experience for the comparable license;
and,

Successfully completed a comparable written state electrical examination based
on the current edition of the National Electrical Code in effect at the time the
application is submitted to the Board.

2. Proof of successful completion of the requirements in Board Rule 1.4(E) shall be
submitted on the verification forms prepared and furnished by the Board, as part of the
application for endorsement.

3. Qualification may be accumulated in multiple states, provided the qualifications meet the
requirements of Board Rule 1.4(E)(1).

F. License by Reciprocity
1. Conditions for reciprocity for a Colorado journeyman electrician’s license. Applicants
must:
a. Hold, from the licensing state, a journeyman license or a master electrician

license, that allows the individual to work as a journeyman electrician, that is
current, active, and in good standing;

Possess a journeyman electrician’s license, or master electrician's license from a
state that is a member in good standing of the National Electrical Reciprocal
Alliance (NERA), or from any entity or jurisdiction that has a reciprocity
agreement with the Board.




CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR710-1
State Electrical Board

1.5

2. Applicants will not be granted a reciprocal license where the license in the licensing state
was granted by grandfathering without having passed a state-administered examination.

3. A Colorado master electrician’s license may not be granted by reciprocity.

Military. Education, training, or service gained in military services outlined in section 12-20-
202(4), C.R.S,, to be accepted and applied towards receiving a license, must be substantially
equivalent, as determined by the Board, to the qualifications otherwise applicable at the time of
receipt of application. It is the applicant’s responsibility to provide timely and complete evidence
for review and consideration. Satisfactory evidence of such education, training, or service will be
assessed on a case by case basis.

Reconsideration. An applicant requesting reconsideration of a Board action or requesting a
personal interview before the Board, shall submit the request in writing, accompanied by
additional information or documentation not made available to the Board prior to a previous ruling.
This request shall be submitted within forty-five days of the date on which the Board made the
decision. Any request filed after forty-five days will not be considered by the Board.

Temporary Work Permits

1. Pursuant to section 12-115-114, C.R.S., a temporary work permit may be issued at the
time of approval for an examination. The temporary permit will be valid for a pericd of no

more than thirty (30) days after the date of approval or as otherwise limited in section 12-
115-114, C.R.S.

2. A temporary work permit shall not be accepted to meet the requirements for obtaining a
new electrical contractor registration.

a. A temporary master electrician work permit may be issued to a qualified applicant
of an existing electrical contractor pursuant to section 12-115-114, C.R.S.

Application Retention

1. Incomplete Applications. An application for a license by examination or endorsement
submitted without all required fees and documentation will be considered incomplete.
Incomplete applications will be retained for one year from the date originally submitted,

after which applicants shall begin the process again including payment of the application
fee.

2. Approved Applications without Activity. Effective November 30, 2012, an approved
applicant for licensure by examination who does not take the examination within three
years from the date of the original approval date will be required to begin the application
process again including payment of the application fee.

3. Approved Applications with Activity. Effective November 30, 2012, an approved applicant
for licensure by examination who takes the examination but does not pass the
examination within five years from the date of the original approval date will be required
to begin the application process again including payment of the application fee.

EXAMINATIONS

The candidate must present positive photo identification in order to be admitted to the
examination area.




CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR710-1
State Electrical Board

B. Proprietary Information. The content and answers to examinations and assessments for licensure
or renewal administered by the Board are proprietary property. Licensees and registrants shall
not disclose, or offer to disclose any portion of the examinations or assessment to others.
Licensees and registrants may be subject to disciplinary action by the Board should they disclose,
or offer to disclose, sell or otherwise distribute the content and/or answers for any examinations
or assessments administered by the Board.

C. Examination results will be provided in writing to each examinee in a pass or fail format. Results
will not be given in any other manner.

D. Examinations shall not be subject to review by candidates.

1.6 RENEWAL AND REINSTATEMENT (repealed on August 1, 2017 - Rule 1.6 Replaced in its
entirety by Rule 11.0 effective January 1, 2018, with exception of Rule 6.4)

1.7 PERMITS, INSPECTIONS, AND VERIFICATION OF LICENSES AND REGISTRATIONS

A. Permits
1. Wiring permit applications shall be issued in the name of the qualified épplicant (see
section 12-115-116 (2), C.R.S.) or registered electrical contractor performing the
electrical work. The qualified applicant is defined as a homeowner performing work in
accordance with statutory requirements.
2. A permit shall be required for all systems supplying power that may normally be supplied

by an electrical utility, such as, but not limited to, solar, wind, hydroelectric and other
generated sources. (The Board or its administrative officer may revoke a permit that was
issued in error or on the basis of incorrect information supplied by the applicant.)

3. Any permit issued as a result of fraudulent or incorrect information supplied on the
application shall be cancelied.

4, An electrical contractor shall not purchase a permit for use by another company or
individual.
5. A contractor shall not perform any electrical work under a homeowner's permit or prior

electrical contractor’s permit but shall secure a new electrical permit in the name of the
contractor performing the work.

Exception: A project where subcontractors may be needed to perform work under th
direction and existing permit of the prime electrical contractor. :

6. Any work commencing prior to the purchase of a permit is subject to twice the prescribed
permit fee.

7. Stop Work Order
a. Notice to owner. Upon notice from the electrical inspector that work on any

building or structure is being installed contrary to the provisions of this code or in
an unsafe and dangerous manner, such work shall be immediately stopped. The
stop work order shall be in writing and shall be given to the owner of the property
involved, or to the owner's agent or to the person doing the work, or posted at the
job site and shall state the conditions under which work will be permitted to
resume.




CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR710-1
State Electrical Board

b. Unlawful continuance. Any person who shall continue any work in or about the
structure after having been served with a stop work order, except such work as
that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall
be subject to penalties as prescribed by this article.

C. Additions, alterations or repairs may be made to any electrical system and
equipment without requiring the existing electrical system and equipment to
comply with all the requirements of the Board standards, provided that the
addition, alteration or repair conforms to that required for a new electrical system
and equipment, and provided further that no hazard to life, health or safety will be
created by such additions, alterations or repairs.

d. Existing electrical wiring systems may continue to be energized provided that
they were lawfully installed and that they present no hazard to life, health or
property.

e. Services to moved buildings shall comply with the standards of the Board for new

installations. The existing electrical wiring may be re-energized provided that a
registered electrical contractor gives written verification to the Board that the
existing electrical installation presents no hazard to life, health or property.
Permits and inspections shall be required.

B. Inspections

1.

2.

An inspection request will only be accepted from the permit owner or their agent.

An individual requesting an electrical inspection shall provide reasonable access to the
inspection area during the normal working hours of the Board office.

Article 110.2, “Approval”, in the National Electrical Code, provides that conductors and
equipment required or permitted by this code shall be acceptable only when “approved”.
The Board will accept conductors and equipment that have been tested and approved by
a recognized testing agency such as Underwriters Laboratories, Inc., or field-evaluated
by a certified Field Evaluation Body (FEB) in accordance with NFPA 790 and 791. FEB
certification is to be provided by International Accreditation Service (IAS) or equal. The
Board reserves the right of its inspectors to reject any conductors or equipment that in
their opinion may be unsafe or injurious to life or property.

An incorporated town or city, county, city and county, or qualified state institution of
higher education shall ensure that its inspections are performed by inspectors who
possess the qualifications required under section 12-115-119, C.R.S. Failure to do so
may be deemed a failure to meet the minimum requirements of this article under section
12-115-107(2)(j), C.R.S.

Reinspection Fees. A reinspection fee may be assessed at the discretion of the inspector
for reasons including, but not limited to, the following:

a. The job is not ready for an inspection and an extra trip is required for the
inspector (a job with multiple code violations may be considered “not ready” by
the inspector).

b. Corrections have not been made to all code violations cited from previous
inspection.

10



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3CCR710-1

State Electrical Board

c. No access to the job site for reasons including but not limited to; locked gate or
door, snow not plowed, no escort into an occupied structure, etc. (inspectors may
not enter an occupied residence without an escort at least eighteen years or
older).

d. Hazardous construction site as determined by the inspector or OSHA guidelines
(may include loose dogs, etc.).

e. Address not posted so as to be visible from the street or road.

f. Improper directions to jobsite given on permit or inspection requests.

g. A reinspection shall not be performed until the reinspection fee has been paid.

h. A final inspection shall not be performed until a permanent electrical load
consistent with the type of structure is connected.

i As used in section 12-115-122(1)(c), C.R.S., the term “reasonable time” shall
mean thirty calendar days, unless the licensee or registrant appeals to the Board
for a hearing on the matter, in which case the thirty calendar day time period
shall be extended by the Board until the Board rules on the appeal. The thirty
calendar day time period shall restart after the Board issues a ruling on the
appeal.

C. License and Registration verification

1.8

1.

An inspector shall, based on that inspector’s familiarity with the installer, require each
individual doing electrical work as defined by section 12-115-103, C.R.S., to produce
documentation showing they are a currently licensed Colorado state electrician or
registered apprentice.

2. Such documentation must either be on their person or may be on the job site where it is
readily attainable for presentation to the inspector upon request.
ENFORCEMENT

Cooperation with Board Investigations. Licensees and registrants having knowledge of, and/or
involvement in, any alleged violation of Title 12, Article 115, and/or Board Rules, shall cooperate

with any investigation initiated by the Board and timely furnish such information or assistance as
may be requested.

Report Convictions, Judgments, and Administrative Proceedings

1.

A licensee or registrant shall inform the Board, in @ manner set forth by the Board, within
forty-five days of any of the following occurrences: the conviction of the registrant or
licensee of a felony under the laws of any State or of the United States.

A licensee or registrant convicted of a felony under the laws of any State or of the United
States is grounds for discipline pursuant to section 12-115-122, C.R.S.

For purposes of this Rule, a “conviction” includes:
a. A guilty verdict;

b. A plea of guilty accepted by the court: or

11



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR710-1

State Electrical Board

C. A plea of nolo contendere (no contest) accepted by the court.

4, The notice to the Board shall include the following information:
a. The court;
b. The jurisdiction;
c. The case name;
d. The case number; and,
e. A description of the matter or copy of the indictment or charges.

5. The licensee or registrant shall inform the Board of the following information within forty-
five days of each such occurrence:
a. The imposition of a sentence for a felony conviction: and,
b. The completion of all terms of a sentence for a felony conviction.

6. The licensee or registrant notifying the Board may submit a written statement with any
notice under this Rule to be included in the registrant or licensee records.

7. This Rule shall apply to any conviction or plea as described in Board Rule 1.8(B)(3).

C. Citations

1. The citation form shall be completed by the state electrical inspector. Citations will be
served by certified mail or in person by a state electrical inspector. Completed, served
citation forms will be mailed to the Board for review. The Board maintains the discretion
to dismiss the citation at any time.

2. The citation form shall direct the recipient to respond in one of the following ways within
ten working days after service of the citation:
a. Pay the fine; or
b. Submit a written request to negotiate a stipulated settlement agreement with the

Program Director; or

C. Submit a written request for a formal administrative hearing.

3. Fines
a. If one of the following actions has not been taken by the citation recipient within

ten working days following the service of the citation, the citation shall become a
final Board action:

) Full payment of the fine;
(2) Written request for negotiation of a stipulated settlement agreement;

(3) Written request for a formal administrative hearing.

12



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR710-1

State Electrical Board
b. In any action to collect a fine, the Board shall seek reasonable attorney fees and
costs.
c. For good cause the Board may extend the 10 day working period, as set forth in
Board Rule 1.8(C)(3)(a), in which a citation recipient may request a hearing.
4, Negotiations

a. A written request and explanation for negotiation of a stipulated settlement
agreement shall be submitted to the Program Director or designee and may
include information in mitigation of the violation. The date the request for
negotiation of a stipulated agreement is received by the Program Director
constitutes the submittal date. After reviewing the requested settlement
information, the Program Director has the option to authorize the following
actions:

1) Issue a letter of admonition;

(2) Dismiss the citation;

(3) Reduce the fine;

(4) Arrange a payment schedule;

(5) Permit a personal appearance before the Board; and/or,

(6) Refer the matter for a formal administrative hearing.

b. Negotiations may terminate for reasons including but not limited to:

(1) The recipient admits to committing the violation:

(2) The recipient does not conduct settlement negotiations timely and in
writing;

(3) The recipient does not present reasonable mitigating or extenuating
information in writing;

(4) The Program Director determines the settlement negotiations are not
being conducted in good faith or are being conducted for the purpose of
delay;

(5) It appears unlikely the parties will reach a negotiated resolution; and/or,

(6) The recipient has prior violations that need to be brought to the Board’s
attention prior to attempting settlement negotiations.

C. A stipulated settlement agreement shall be considered a violation for the purpose

of determining the fine amount in subsequent violations. The stipulated
settlement agreement may contain an admission of the violation(s). A stipulated
settlement agreement shall be signed and dated by both the Program Director or
Board chair or designee and the citation recipient. A stipulated settiement
agreement shall be approved by the Board in order to become a final agency
order.

13



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS
State Electrical Board

3 CCR710-1

A written request from the citation recipient to proceed to a formal hearing may
be submitted at any time during settlement negotiations. If the negotiations are
subsequently deemed futile, the citation recipient shall be notified that payment
of the fine or request a formal administrative hearing shall be submitted within ten
calendar days. Written settlement information may be used against the licensee,
registrant, applicant or respondent at the hearing when unsuccessful settlement
negotiations proceed to a formal hearing.

When the citation recipient retains an attorney for assistance during stipulated
settlement negotiations, the Board or Program Director may request the Attorney
General to assist with settlement negotiations.

Hearings. Hearings shall be conducted in accordance with the Administrative

Procedure Act. The hearings shall be conducted by an administrative law judge
at the Office of Administrative Courts. The citation recipient may be represented
by counsel of his or her choosing.

)] At the formal administrative hearing, the Board may pursue the award of
the maximum fine allowed by statute. At the formal administrative
hearing, the Board may also pursue the award of any other disciplinary
sanctions such as revocation, suspension or probation. The Board shall
review the entire citation history of a licensee, as found in the Board's
records, in any disciplinary action against a licensee.

g. Inspectors shall not negotiate settlements or accept payment of fines.

D. Fine Schedule. The following is the current fine schedule adopted by the Board pursuant to

section 12-115-122(3)(a), C.R.S.

e Statutory 1st 2nd Subsequent
Violation Provision Offense | Offense Offense
Er)gagmg in the bus'm.ess, t_rade, or.camng of 12-115-109(1) $225 $600 Up to0 $2,000
a journeyman electrician without a license per day
Engaging in the business, trade, or calling of 415 Up to $2,000
a master electrician without a license 12-115-109(1) $300 $600 per day
Engaging in the business, trade, or calling of 415 Up to $2,000
a residential wireman without a license 12-115-109(2) $150 $375 per day
Performing electrical work beyond the s Up to $2,000
authorization of a residential wireman license 12-115-109(1) $375 $750 per day
Failure of an electrical contractor to register 12-115-115(3) $225 $600 Up to $2,000
an apprentice 12-115-122(1)(a) per day
Failure of a licensee or registered apprentice Up to $2,000
to produce a license or registration as 12-115-122(1)(b) $50 $200 P '
) per day
required by Rule 7.3

14




CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS

3 CCR710-1
State Electrical Board
L. Statutory 1st 2nd Subsequent
Violation Provision Offense | Offense Offense
Employment by an electrical contractor of s Up t0 $2,000
unlicensed persons doing electrical work 12-118-122(1)(k) $300 $600 per day
Engaging in the business of an electrical Up to $2,000
contractor without obtaining registration from | 12-115-110(5)(a) $750 $1,500 P ’
per day
the Board
. . . . 12-115-115(1),
:re:l;ugergfnzchecensed electrician to supervise 12-115-115(3)(b) $375 $600 Up tgrs(sjéooo
P 12-115-122(1)()) peraay
Failure of an electrical contractor to maintain Up to $2.000
a supervisory ratio of one licensed electrician 12-115-115(1) $375 $600 P or da,
to three apprentices P y
Failure to obtain a permit and/or failure to 12-115-120 $375 $900 Up t0 $2,000
obtain an inspection 12-115-122(1)(a) per day
Failure to remove a cause for disapproval of Up to $2.000
any electrical instalfation within a reasonable | 12-115-122(1)(c) $450 $900 P or da;
time P y
Advertising by a licensee or registrant which Up to $2,000
is false or misleading 12-115-122(1)(h) $375 $750 per day
Deception, misrepresentation or fraud in Up to $2,000
obtaining or attempting to obtain a license 12-115-122(1)() $1,000 $2,000 P or da’
(includes loaning a license) P y
Failure to comply with cther state or federal Up to $2,000
law (safety, health, insurance, tax) 12-115-122(1)(p) 3375 $750 per day
Other violations of the state electrical 12-115-122(1) Upto Up to Up to $2,000
statutes, rules, or Board orders. $1,000 $2,000 per day
E. Compliance. Payment of a fine assessed from a citation does not relieve the receiver of the

citation from correcting the situation, installation, statute or code violation noted in the citation.

1.9 DECLARATORY ORDERS

A. Any person may petition the Board for a declaratory order to terminate controversies or to remove
uncertainties as to the applicability to the petitioner of any statutory provision or of any rule or

order of the Board.

B. The Board will determine, in its discretion and without notice to the petitioner, whether to rule

upon any such petition. If the Board determines that it will not rule upon such a petition, the Board
shall promptly notify the petitioner of its action and state the reasons for such action.

The Board shall consider the following matters, among others in determining whether to rule upon
a petition filed pursuant to this Rule:

15



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR710-1
State Electrical Board

1. If a rule on the petition will terminate a controversy or remove uncertainties as to the
applicability to petitioner of any statutory provision or rule or order of the Board.

2. If the petition involves any subject, question or issue which is the subject of a formal or
informal matter or investigation currently pending before the Board or a court involving
one or more of the petitioners.

3. If the petition involves any subject, question or issue that is the subject of a formal or
informal matter of investigation currently pending before the Board or a court but not
involving any petitioner.

4, If the petition seeks a ruling on a moot or hypothetical question or will result in an
advisory ruling or opinion.

5. If the petitioner has some other adequate legal remedy, other than an action for
declaratory relief pursuant to Rule 57, Colo. R. Civ.P., that will terminate the controversy
or remove any uncertainty as to the applicability to the petitioner of the statute, rule or
order in guestion.

D. A petition filed pursuant to this Rule shall set forth the following:

1. The name and address of the petitioner and whether the petitioner is licensed pursuant to
the organic act.

2. The statute, rule or order to which the petition relates; and,

3. A concise statement of all of the facts necessary to show the nature of the controversy or
uncertainty and the manner in which the statute, rule or order in question applies or
potentially applies to the petitioner.

E. If the Board determines that it will rule on the petition, the following procedures shall apply:

1.

The Board may rule upon the petition based solely upon the facts presented in the
petition. in such a case:

a. Any ruling of the Board will apply only to the extent of the facts presented in the
petition and any amendment to the petition.

b. The Board may order the petitioner to file a written brief, memorandum or
statement of position.

C. The Board may set the petition, upon due notice to petitioner, for a non-
evidentiary hearing.

d. The Board may dispose of the petition on the sole basis of the matters set forth in
the petition.

e. The Board may request the petitioner to submit additional facts, in writing. In
such event, such additional facts will be considered as an amendment to the
petition.

16



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3CCR710-1
State Electrical Board

1.10

f. The Board may take administrative notice of facts pursuant to the Administrative
Procedure Act (section 24-4-105(8), C.R.S.) and may utilize its experience,
technical competence and specialized knowledge in the disposition. If the Board
rules upon the petition without a hearing, it shall promptly notify the petitioner of
its decision.

2. The Board may, in its discretion, set the petition for hearing upon due notice to petitioner,
for the purpose of obtaining additional facts or information or to determine the truth of any
facts set forth in the petition or to hear oral argument on the petition. The notice to the
petitioner setting such hearing shall set forth, to the extent known, the factual or other
matters into which the Board intends to inquire. For the purpose of such a hearing, to the
extent necessary, the petitioner shall have the burden of proving all of the facts stated in
the petition, all of the facts necessary to show the nature of the controversy or uncertainty
and the manner in which the statute, rule or order in question applies or potentially
applies to the petitioner and any other facts the petitioner desires the Board to consider.

The parties to any proceeding pursuant to this Rule shall be the Board and the petitioner. Any
other person may seek leave of the Board to intervene in such a proceeding, and leave to
intervene will be granted at the sole discretion of the Board. A petition to intervene shall set forth
the same matters as required by Board Rule 1.7(D). Any reference to a “petitioner” in this Rule
also refers to any person who has been granted leave to intervene by the Board.

A declaratory order or other order disposing of a petition pursuant to this Rule shall constitute
agency action subject to judicial review pursuant to section 24-4-106, C.R.S.

ELECTRICAL INSPECTOR QUALIFICATIONS

Applicant. All applicants for the position of state electrical inspector must possess a current
journeyman or master electrician license issued by the State of Colorado.

Electrician License. Electrical inspectors must maintain a current Colorado journeyman or master
electrician license.

Residential Inspector Training. Persons who are undergoing their two year practical electrical

inspection experience training pursuant to section 12-115-1 19(1)(a)(1)(B), C.R.S. (one year being
the equivalent of 2,000 hours):

1. Shall be accompanied at all times by a Colorado licensed electrician who is employed as
an electrical inspector by the same jurisdictional authority;

2. Shall complete all of the two year practical training in the field, under actual electrical
inspection situations;

3. Shall not provide any electrical inspections without being accompanied by a Colorado
licensed electrical inspector;

4. Shall not sign off any electrical inspections; and

5, Shall not release any electrical meter sets to any electrical utility.

Registration with The State. Persons qualifying as residential electrical inspectors pursuant to
section 12-115-119(1)(a)(1)(B), C.R.S., shall, when registering with the state pursuant to section
12-115-118(1)(a)(I1)(b) prior to assumption of their duties, furnish satisfactory evidence of their
two year practical experience in the electrical inspection of residential dwellings to include.

17



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR710-1
State Electrical Board

1.

2.

3.

Beginning and ending dates;
Instructor name(s); and

Jurisdiction in which training was conducted

RENEWAL AND REINSTATEMENT (Effective August 1, 2017 Replacing Rule 1.6 in its
entirety, excepting Rule 1.11(C))

Renewal. Board issued licenses and electrical contractor registrations shall be renewed every
three years to correspond with the Board's adoption of the National Electrical Code.

1.

A licensee or registrant shall have a sixty day grace period to renew such license or
registration without the imposition of a disciplinary sanction for practicing on an expired
license or registration. During this grace period, a delinquency fee shall be charged for
late renewal.

A licensee or registrant who does not renew such license or registration within the sixty
day grace period shall be deemed as having an expired license or registration and shall
be ineligible to practice until such license or registration is reinstated. If the licensee or
registrant practices with an expired license or registration, the Board may impose
disciplinary actions.

Reinstatement. An expired license may be reinstated by submitting a reinstatement application,
paying the current reinstatement fee, and meeting the appropriate requirements below.

1.

Expired for More Than Sixty Days But Less Than Two Years. To reinstate a license that
has been expired for more than sixty days but less than two years, the applicant must
provide evidence of completion, since applicant’'s most recent licensing event (original
license, renewal or reinstatement) preceding the application for reinstatement, of twenty-
four hours of continuing education, as defined in Board Rule 1.11(C).

Expired for More Than Two Years. [f the license has been expired for more than two
years, pursuant to section 12-20-202(2)(c)(ll), C.R.S., the applicant must demonstrate
competency to practice by any of the following:

a. Satisfactorily pass the state electrical examination;

b. Provide verification of an active license with a state where a reciprocal
agreement for an equivalent license exists;

C. Provide verification of active licensure in a non-reciprocal state as follows:

1) Verify an active residential wireman's license, journeyman electrician's
license, or master electrician’s license in non-reciprocal state, respective
to the license being reinstated; and,

(2) Evidence of completing twenty-four continuing education hours pursuant
to Board Rule 1.11(C) since applicant’s most recent licensing event
(original license, renewal or reinstatement) preceding the application for
reinstatement.

d. By other means approved by the Board.

18



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR710-1

State Electrical Board

C. Continuing Education Requirements

1.

Statutory Basis. Pursuant to section 12-115-110(4)(d)(1)(A), C.R.S., the Board shall adopt
rules establishing continuing education requirements and standards that a licensee shall
demonstrate in order to renew a license on or after January 1, 2018. Such requirements
and standards must include course work related to the National Electrical Code, including
core competencies as determined by the board.

Basis of Requirements. As established by the Colorado General Assembly, the regulatory
authority of the Board is to establish continuing education standards to renew, reinstate
or reactivate a license and the documentation necessary to demonstrate compliance.

Definitions

Core Competencies: Core Competencies are technical and professional
subjects, related to the practice of electrical work, which the Board deems
necessary to safeguard the public.

Continuing Education Pre-Approval Guide: An instructional manual detailing the
pre-approval process of providers, courses and instructors. This manual will
instruct providers how to obtain Board pre-approval as a provider and for courses
and instructors.

Inactive Status: A licensee is not required to comply with continuing education
requirements to renew a license in inactive status. An individual whose license is
in inactive status is prohibited by law from practicing as a licensed electrician.

National Electrical Code: The National Electrical Code shall refer to the code for
the safe installation of electrical wiring and equipment, as amended, published by
the National Fire Protection Association and approved by the American National
Standards Institute, or its successor organization.

Pre-approved list: A publically available list containing providers and courses that
have been pre-approved by the Board. Credit will be earned by a licensee if
completing a course on this pre-approved list.

Requirements

a.

Each renewal cycle following the 2017 renewal of a license, a licensee in active
status shall complete twenty-four hours of continuing education in order to renew
a license to perform electrical work in Colorado. The continuing education hours
must be selected from among the four Core Competencies below in any
combination, except that a minimum of four continuing education hours must be
related to National Electrical Code changes and a maximum of four hours must
be related to safety training:

(1 Grounding and Bonding

(2) National Electrical Code changes
(3) Wiring methods

(4) Theory and calculations

(5) Safety related to the electrical industry.

19



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3CCR710-1

State Electrical Board

b. Continuing education credits will only apply to one three-year renewal period.

C. Licensees shall cooperate with the Board to determine compliance with
continuing education requirements,

d. The requirements stated in Board Rule 1.11(C) shall apply to:
(1 All original electrical licenses granted after August 1, 2017;
(2) All electrical licenses upon completion of 2017 renewal.

e. All electricians are subject to Board Rule 1.6 until either his/her 2017 renewal is
completed, or until December 31, 2017.

5, Pre-Approval of Continuing Education. Continuing education providers, courses and

instructors must be pre-approved by the Board before a licensee can earn continuing
education credit toward the continuing education requirement as described in Board Rule
1.11(C). Pre-approval of providers, courses and instructors shall expire on December
31st of the final year of the current code cycle.

a.

b.

The Board has sole discretion to approve providers, courses and instructors.

Providers: Providers will be considered approved if they have a course approved
by the Board.

(1) Each Provider will be issued a unique Provider Approval Number, which
must be included on all course or instructor approval submissions.

(2) If the content of a course is changed before the approval expires, the
Provider must re-submit the course for pre-approval.

(3) As proof of course completion, the Board will accept a certificate of
compiletion from the course provider.

(4) Certificates of completion shall not be issued to attendees unless the
course is successfully completed. Certificates of completion shall include
all of the following elements:

(a) Name of attendee;

(b) Attendee’s Colorado electrician’s license number;
(c) Date of course

(d) Provider name and approval number;

(e) Course title and approval number;

f) fnstructor name and approval number; and

(9) Number hours of continuing education credit earned.

Courses: Criteria for approval of a course shall include the following:

20



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR710-1

State Electrical Board

(1) Each course shall cover one of four core competencies, as listed in
Board Rule 1.11(C)(4)(a). Course credit will apply to only one core
competency per course,

(2) All online courses or webinars shall be interactive. Each course must
have capabilities in place to ensure active participation and demonstrate
comprehension a minimum of once per hour, and fast forward must be
disabled.

(3) After approval, each course will be issued a unique Course Approval
Number, which must be included on all course or instructor approval
submissions.

d. Instructors: Courses must be taught by instructors with the following
qualifications:

(1) Instructors must be sponsored by a Colorado approved Provider.

(2) Instructor's background and experience must meet at least one of the
following criteria.

(a) Graduate electrical engineer licensed as an electrician;

(b) Hold a minimum of a Colorado journeyman electrician’s license
(or equivalent) plus a minimum of one year of journeyman
electrician field experience;

(c) Community college or vo-tech instructor as approved by the
Board; or

(d) Electrical continuing education instructor from other areas as
approved by the Board.

{e) Instructor shall provide documentation of background and
experience as requested by the Board.

(1) For tracking purposes, each approved Instructor will be issued a unique
Instructor Approval Number, which must be included on all course or
instructor approval submissions.

e. After approval by the Board, approved providers and courses will be placed on
the Board's pre-approved list.

f. The Board has sole discretion to accept or reject any continuing education credit
earned by a licensee that is not on the Board's pre-approved list.

g. The Board has discretion to remove providers, courses, and instructors from the
pre-approved list.

6. Recordkeeping

a. The licensee shall track and document completed continuing education in a
process approved by the Board.

b. The licensee shall retain documentation for a minimum of seven years.

21



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR710-1

State Electrical Board
7. Repealed
8. Audits

a. The Board may conduct audits of continuing education for verification of
compliance with these requirements at any time. The Board may, at its
discretion, disallow any continuing education course completed by a licensee that
was not on the Board's pre-approved list.

b. A licensee shall provide all documentation requested for audit within thirty days
of the request.

9. Multiple Licenses

a. A licensee holding multiple licenses issued by the Board shall complete
continuing education requirements for the most advanced license held.
Completion of continuing education requirements for the most advanced license
shall satisfy the requirements for all lesser licenses.

D. Inactive License Status and Reactivation
1. Inactive License. Pursuant to section 12-70-101, C.R.S., any licensee may apply to the

Board to transfer his or her license to inactive status. Such application shall be in the

form and manner designated by the Board. The holder of an inactive license shall not be

required to comply with continuing education requirements for renewal so long the
license remains inactive.

a. Each holder of an inactive license shall renew once every three years with the
Board in the same manner as active license holders and pay a fee pursuant to
section 12-115-117, C.R.S.

b. During such time as a license remains in an inactive status, the licensee shall not
perform any acts restricted to active licensed electricians. Such practice may be
grounds for revocation.

2.

Reactivation of Inactive License. An inactive license may be reactivated by submitting the
proper application, paying the current reactivation fee, and meeting the appropriate
requirements below.

a.

Inactive for Less Than Three Years. To reactivate a license that has been
inactive for less than three years, the applicant must provide evidence of
completion, within the three years immediately preceding the application for
reinstatement, of twenty-four hours of continuing education, as defined in Board
Rule 1.11(C).

Inactive for More Than Three Years. Pursuant to section 12-115-110(4)(c),
C.R.S., alicensee whose license has been inactive for more than three years
must demonstrate education to practice by any of the following:

) Satisfactorily pass the state electrical examination;

(2) Provide verification of an active license with a state where a reciprocal
agreement for an equivalent license exists;

22



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCRT710-1

State Electrical Board
(3) Provide verification of active licensure in a non-reciprocal state as
follows:

(a) Verify an active residential wireman'’s license, journeyman
electrician’s license, or master electrician’s license in non-
reciprocal state, respective to the license you are reinstating;
and,

(b) Evidence of completing twenty-four continuing education hours
pursuant to Board Rule 1.11(C) in the three years immediately
preceding the application for reinstatement.

4) By other means approved by the Board.
3. Practicing with an Inactive License. Practicing electrical work with a license in inactive

status shall constitute practice without an active license and, therefore, may be grounds
for injunctive or disciplinary action, up to and including revocation.

E. Loss of Responsible Master. An electrical contractor who loses the services of the responsible
master electrician, for any reason, will be allowed twenty days in which to hire another master
electrician. If the electrical contractor has not hired another master electrician during that period,
the Board shall place the electrical contractor registration into inactive status until such time that

the contractor submits evidence that a master electrician has been hired, and the appropriate fee
has been paid.

F. Any licensed or registered individual working as an electrician shall be required to carry on their
person the appropriate license, temporary work permit, or registration.

1.

Personal Information Change

A licensee or registrant shall inform the Board in a clear, explicit, and unambiguous
written statement of any name, address, telephone, or email change within thirty (30)
days of the change. The Board will not change the licensee or registrant information
without explicit written notification from the licensee or registrant. Notification by any
manner approved by the Board is acceptable.

a. The Division of Professions and Occupations maintains one contact address for
each licensee or registrant, regardless of the number of licenses or registrations
the licensee or registrant may hold.

b. Address change requests for some, but not all, communications or for
confidential communications only are not accepted.

The Board requires one of the following forms of documentation to change the name or
social security number of a licensee or registrant:

a. Marriage license;

b. Divorce decree;

C. Court order; or

d. A driver’s license or social security card with a second form of identification may

be acceptable at the discretion of the Division of Professions and Occupations.

23



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR710-1
State Electrical Board

H. Contractor Registration and Advertising

1. Registered Electrical Contractors shall not advertise in any manner, by any name,
including DBAs, other than the registered company name on record with Department of
Regulatory Agencies.

Editor's Notes

History

Entire rule eff. 08/01/2008.

Rules 3.7, 5.0-5.2, 9.0-10.0 eff. 08/01/2010.

Entire rule eff. 03/17/2011.

Rules 8.1, 9.7 m eff. 09/15/2011.

Rules 3.0-10.7 eff. 07/15/2012.

Entire rule eff. 07/01/2014.

Rules 2.2, 3.1, 4.4.1.2.B, 4.4.1.3.A eff. 01/30/2015.
Entire rule eff. 03/17/2017.

Rule 2.0 eff. 06/01/2017.

Rules 6.0, 11.0 eff. 07/15/2017.

Rules 7.2.5.9, 8.3.3, 11.2 eff. 03/17/2018. Rule 11.3.7 repealed eff. 03/17/2018.
Rule 8.3.3. eff. 11/14/2018.

Rule 1.2 eff. 07/15/2020.

24



Z795 % Code of Colorado Regulations
i Secretary of State

State of Colorado

DEPARTMENT OF REGULATORY AGENCIES

State Plumbing Board

PLUMBING RULES AND REGULATIONS

3 CCR 7201
[Editor's Notes follow the text of the rules at the end of this CCR Document.]

1.1

1.2

STATEMENT OF BASIS AND PURPOSE

The following Rules and Regulations of the Colorado State Plumbing Board (“Board”) are
necessary for general clarification, efficient management, expeditious procedures, and
safeguarding of the general public, in compliance with Title 12, Article 155 of the Colorado
Revised Statutes. These Rules and Regulations shall be known, and may be cited, as “the Rules”
and/or “these Rules.”

The Board adopts the following Rules pursuant to the authority granted to the Colorado State
Plumbing Board (“Board”) by sections 12-155-105(1)(e) and 12-155-106(1) and (5), C.R.S., and
hereby repeals all previous rules with the same number.

These Rules shall be binding on every person and legal entity authorized to practice, offer to
practice, or perform plumbing or plumbing contracting as well as jurisdictions granted authority to
perform permitting and inspections and their inspectors in Colorado. All licensees, registrants and
plumbing inspectors under Title 12, Article 155 of the Colorado Revised Statutes are charged with
having knowledge of the existence of these Rules and shall be deemed to be familiar with their
provisions and to understand the Rules. In these Rules, the word “licensee” shall mean any
person holding a master plumber license, journeyman plumber license, or residential plumber
license. In these Rules, the word “registrant” shall mean any person registered as a plumbing
apprentice and any person or legal entity registered with the Board as a plumbing contractor.

These Rules are severable. If one rule or portion of a rule is found to be invalid, all other rules or

portions of rules that can be enforced without the invalid rules shall be enforced and shall remain
valid.

STANDARDS
Colorado Plumbing Code

The Board hereby adopts and incorporates by reference, with certain additions, revisions, and
deletions, the following chapters, sections, and appendices of the International Plumbing Code
(“IPC”) and International Residential Code (“IRC").

These Rules, together with the following incorporated provisions, shall be known as the Colorado
Plumbing Code. The Colorado Plumbing Code sets forth the minimum standards governing the
inspection, installation, alteration, and repair of the plumbing fixtures, appliances, and systems
throughout Colorado. The Colorado Plumbing Code does not include any later amendments to or
editions of the IPC or IRC provisions listed below.

1. Chapter 1, Sections 101.2, 102, 105, 106.1, 106.3, 106.4, 106.5, 106.5.5, 106.6.1, 107,
108.1, 110.3 Chapters 2-13, 15; and Appendices B, C, D, and E of the IPC, 2018 edition,
promulgated by the International Code Council, 1st printing (August 2017).




CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR720-1
State Plumbing Board

2. Chapter 1, Section R101, R102; Chapter 2; Chapter 3, Section R305.1 exceptions 1 and
2, Section R306; Chapters 25-32, of the IRC, 2018 edition, promulgated by the
International Code Council, 1st printing (August 2017).

B. Colorado Fuel Gas Code

The Board hereby adopts and incorporates by reference, with certain additions, revisions, and
deletions, the following chapters, sections, and appendices of the International Fuel Gas Code
("IFGC") and the IRC. These Rules, together with the following incorporated provisions, shall be
known as the Colorado Fuel Gas Code. The Colorado Fuel Gas Code sets forth the minimum
standards governing the inspection, installation, alteration, and repair of fuel gas piping and
systems throughout Colorado. The Colorado Fuel Gas Code does not include any later
amendments to or editions of the IFGC and IRC provisions listed below.

1. Chapter 1 Section 101, 102, 105, 107, Chapters 2-8 save and except Sections 412 and
413, Appendices A-C of the IFGC, 2018 edition, promulgated by the International Code
Council, 1st printing (August 2017).

2. Chapter 1, Section R101, R102; Chapter 2; Chapter 24, Sections G2411-G2422, and
G2401.1-Table G2428.3(4) and G2448 of the IRC, 2018 edition, promulgated by the
International Code Council, 1st printing (August 2017).

C. Public Copies

Copies of the provisions of the IPC, IFGC, and IRC, adopted and incorporated into the Colorado
Plumbing Code and the Colorado Fuel Gas Code, are available for public inspection during
regular business hours at the Board office at the Department of Regulatory Agencies Welcome
Center, 1560 Broadway, Civic Center Plaza, Denver, Colorado, 80202, and at any state
publications depository library. For further information regarding how this material can be
obtained or examined, contact the Program Director for the Board (“Program Director”) at 1560
Broadway, Suite 1350, Denver, Colorado, 80202, (303) 894-2309. Copies of the IPC, IFGD, and
IRC may be obtained from the International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th
Floor, Washington, DC 20001. A list of ICC regional offices is available at
http://www.iccsafe.org/AboutlCC/Pages/ContactiCC.aspx.

D. General Interpretations

The following shail apply to the Colorado Plumbing Code and Colorado Fuel Gas Code.

1. Code Official. Whenever the Colorado Plumbing Code and the Colorado Fuel Gas Code
refer to “the code official,” it shall mean the Board or its designee, if any.

2, Reasonable Time. As used in the Rules, the term “reasonable time” shall mean thirty
calendar days.

3. Amendments to the Colorado Codes. Any city, town, county or city and county which
adopts more stringent standards than the Colorado Codes shall furnish a copy thereof to
the Board.

4. Abbreviations

ANSI — American National Standards Institute

ASME — American Society of Mechanical Engineers




CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR 7201
State Plumbing Board

ASSE — American Society of Sanitary Engineers
ASTM — American Society for Testing and Materials
C.F.R. — Code of Federal Requirements

C.R.S. — Colorado Revised Statutes

[CC — International Code Council

NFPA — National Fire Protection Association

USC FCCC&HR — University of Southern California, Foundation for Cross-Connection
Control and Hydraulic Research

5. Alternate Materials and Methods Review

a. Criteria. The Board shall consider requests for approva!l of alternate materials or
methods under the procedures and limitations of Section 105 of the Colorado
Plumbing Code and Colorado Fuel Gas Code.

b. Procedures

) Petitions for Approval. Any interested person may petition the Board to
amend the Colorado Plumbing or Fuel Gas Code so as to approve the
use of an alternate material or method, pursuant to Section 105 of the
IPC. Such petition shall conform to the requirements in subsection (2)(b).
Incomplete petitions will not be processed.

(2) Petition Contents. Each petition filed under this Rule shall comply with
the following requirements:

(a) Where to Submit. Petitions shall be submitted in duplicate to the
Program Director.

(b) Petition Document. Petitions shall begin with a short concise
document labeled as the “petition,” and which includes the
following information:

(i) Identification of the petitioner and the petitioner's interest
in the alternate materials or methods approval. This
identification shall designate one person as the Board's
contact for the petition, and list telephone, fax, e-mai,
and mailing addresses for that person.

(i) A full description of the types of uses for which the
petitioner would like approval. This list should be
sufficiently detailed to allow the Board to consider
specific types of applications or uses for the alternate
material and/or method.




CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR720-1
State Plumbing Board

(iii) A complete identification of the applicable standards
from the Referenced Standards identified in the
Colorado Plumbing Code or Colorado Fuel Gas Code
that the petitioner proposes to be the acceptance criteria
for the alternate material or method.

(iv) If the petition is for approval of an alternate material, one
sample of the material. The sample will be returned to
the petitioner after completion of the review process.

{(v) Copy of approval language of each code the petitioner
cites.
(c) Submission of National Standards. Each petition shall be

accompanied by a set of the applicable standards from the
Referenced Standards identified in the Colorado Plumbing Code,
Colorado Fuel Gas Code or other standards listed by the
petitioner in Rule 1.2(D)(5)(b){(2)(iii). If the listed standard
incorporates other standards into its criteria, copies of the
incorporated standards shall be submitted as well.

{(d) Results of Independent Third Party Compliance Testing.
Each petition shall be supported with complete copies of test
reports with protocols issued within the previous eighteen
months prior to the date of submission by a laboratory or other
testing facility that is recognized as a naticnally recognized
testing laboratory, pursuant to 29 C.F.R. section 1910.7, or by an
ANSI! accredited third-party certifier.

(e) Compliance with Section 105. Each petition shall be supported
by detailed written discussion as to why the proposed alternate
material or method meets the following requirements from
Section 105 of the IPC:

(i) That the proposed design of the proposed alternate
material is satisfactory and complies with the intent of
the Colorado Plumbing Code or Colorado Fuel Gas
Code.

(i) That the proposed material is appropriate for the
proposed intended use at least the equivalent of that
prescribed in the Colorado Plumbing Code or Colorado
Fuel Gas Code with respect to quality, strength,
effectiveness, durability and safety. This description
requires that the petitioner directly compare the quality,
strength, effectiveness, durability and safety data on the
applicable conventional systems with the tested and
documented performance characteristics of the
proposed alternate material and/or method.

(iii) When an alternate installation method is proposed, the
petitioner shall describe how the proposed method of
installation conforms to the most recently adopted
edition of the Colorado Plumbing Code or Colorado Fuel
Gas Code.




CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR 720-1
State Plumbing Board

10.

c. Reconsideration of Board Action

Any petitioner whose petition has not been fully granted by the Board may apply
for reconsideration of the Board'’s decision within thirty days of the mailing of the
Board's notice of denial, publication of notice of termination, or publication of the
Board Rule that partially granted the petition. A request for reconsideration shall
be in writing and shall explain why reconsideration is warranted. Action on any
request for reconsideration is within the sole discretion of the Board.

Fee Establishment. Licensing, permit, and reinspection fees shall be established
pursuant to section 12-20-105, C.R.S., and shall be categorized appropriately, such as
original license, registration, endorsement, renewal, reinstatement fees, permit fees, and
reinspection fees.

Information Only Sections. Installations detailed in the Colorado Plumbing Code that
are typically not installed by plumbers (i.e., shower wall composition from Sections
421.4.1, IPC and P2710.1, IRC; Shower floors from Sections 421.5, IPC and P2709.2,
P2709.3, IRC) are not subject to licensing, permitting or inspection but are informational
only.

Definitions

a. Certified Cross-Connection Control Technician means a person who
possesses a valid Backflow Prevention Assembly Tester certification from one of
the following approved organizations: American Society of Sanitary Engineering
(ASSE), the American Backflow Prevention Association (ABPA), or other agency
recognized by the Board.

Clarification of “Domestic appliances” referenced in section 12-155-118(6)(a)(l), C.R.S.
and “faucets” as shown in section 12-155-118(6)(a)(ll), C.R.S.

Water heaters used to supply domestic hot water to a residential or commercial potable
water system are not equipped with backflow preventers. Therefore, they do not fall
under the exemption in section 12-155-118(6)(a)(l), C.R.S.

Shower valves and tub and shower valves referenced in 2018 IPC sections 412.3 to
412.8 and 2018 IRC section P2708.4 shall not be considered “faucets”. Therefore, they
do not fall under the exemption in section 12-155-118-(6)(a)(ll) CRS.

Clarification of back flow prevention device installation requirements.

A plumbing license is not required for persons engaged in the business of inspecting,
testing, and repairing backflow prevention devices. 12-155-118. Exemptions (4) CRS
requires persons engaged in the installation and removal of such devices to be a
registered and licensed plumbing contractor.

E. Revisions and Exceptions to the Incorporated Codes

1.

Revisions and Exceptions to the Colorado Plumbing Code
a. IPC Section 102.8 Referenced codes and standards

Delete in its entirety and replace with:




CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR 720-1
State Plumbing Board

[A] 102.8 Referenced codes and standards. The codes and standards
referenced in this code shall be those that are listed in Chapter 15 and such
codes and standards adopted or recognized by the Plumbing Board shall be
considered as part of the requirements of this code to the prescribed extent of
each such reference.

b. IPC Section 202 Definitions
Add new definitions to read:

Direct Supervision. Direct supervision means that the supervising licensed
master plumber, journeyman plumber, or residential plumber is physically
present at the same physical addresses listed on the permits and where the
apprentice is working or no more than five minutes distance from the apprentice.

C. IPC Section 202 Definitions
Add new definitions to read:

Trap drain. That portion of horizonta! piping between the weir of a trap and the
point where it intersects with the vent serving that same trap (trap arm).

d. IPC Section 202 Definitions
Delete the definition and replace with:

Fixture Drain. That portion of a plumbing drainage system that connects the trap
drain to any other drain pipe receiving the discharge from one or more plumbing
fixtures.

e. IPC Section 202 Definitions
Delete the definition and replace with:

Graywater. Wastewater that, before being treated or combined with other
wastewater, is collected from fixtures within residential, commercial, or industrial
buildings or institutional facilities for the purpose of being put to beneficial uses.
Sources of graywater are limited to discharges from bathroom and laundry room
sinks, bathtubs, showers, and laundry machines. Graywater does not include the
wastewater from toilets, urinals, kitchen sinks, dishwashers, or non-laundry utility
sinks.

f. IPC Section 202 Definitions
Delete the definition and replace with:
Reclaimed Water. Domestic wastewater that has received secondary treatment
by a domestic wastewater treatment works (centralized system or a localized
system) and such additional treatment as to enable the wastewater to meet the
standards for approved uses.

g. IPC Section 305.1 Protection against contact.

Delete section in it's entirety and replace with:




CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR720-1
State Plumbing Board

IPC Section 305.1 Protection against contact. Piping except for, for cast iron,
ductile iron, and galvanized steel shall not be placed in direct contact with steel
framing members. Piping shall not be placed in direct contact with concrete or
cinder walls and floors, other masonry, and corrosive soil. Where sheathing is
used to prevent direct contact, the sheathing shall have a thickness of not less
than .025 inch (.64 mm). Where sheathing protects piping that penetrates
concrete or masonry walls or floors, the sheathing shall be installed in a manner
that allows movement of the piping within the sheathing.

h. IPC Section 308 Interval of support
308.5 Interval of support
Add new sentence at the end of the section to read:
Hanger support rods shall be sized in accordance with table 308.5.1

i. Add new Table 308.5.1 Hanger Rod Size

Table 308.5.1 Hanger Rod Size
Pipe and Tube Size Rod Size
=4 3/8”
5" -8 23
10" -12" 5/8"
i IPC Section 308.7.1 Location

Delete in its entirety and replace with:

308.7.1 Location. For pipe sizes greater than four inches (102 mm), restraints
shall be provided for drain pipes utilizing mechanical joints at all changes in
direction and at all changes in diameter greater than two pipe sizes. Braces,
blocks, rodding and other suitable methods as specified by the coupling
manufacturer shall be utilized.

k. IPC Section 312.1 Required tests
Delete the words “for piping systems other than plastic” and “After the plumbing
fixtures have been set and their traps filled with water, the entire drainage system
shall be submitted to final tests. The code official shall require the removal of any
cleanouts if necessary to ascertain whether the pressure has reached all parts of
the system.”

I IPC Section 312.3 Drainage and vent air test
Delete the words “Plastic piping shall not be tested using air.”

m. {PC Section 312.4 Drainage and vent final test
Delete in its entirety.

n. IPC Section 312.5 Water supply system test

Delete the words “for piping systems other than plastic.”




CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR 720-1

State Plumbing Board

O.

{PC Section 312.9 Shower liner test

Delete in its entirety.

IPC Section 312.10.1 Inspections

Delete the verbiage entirely and replace it with:

312.10.2 Testing. Reduced pressure principle, double check, pressure vacuum
breaker, reduced pressure detector fire protection, double check detector fire
protection, and spili-resistant vacuum breaker backflow preventer assemblies
and hose connection backflow preventers shall be tested at the time of
installation, immediately after repairs or relocation and at least annually by a
certified cross connection control technician, in accordance with the applicable
testing procedures associated with each specific certifying agency. When
applicable the testing procedure shall be performed for the identified backflow
prevention assembly in its entirety in accordance with one of the following
applicable standards: ASSE 5013, ASSE 5015, ASSE 5020, ASSE 5047, ASSE
5048, ASSE 5052, ASSE 5056, CSA B64.10, CSA B64.10.1 or the testing
procedures provided in the 10th Edition Manual of Cross-Connection Control
from the University of Southern California’s Foundation for Cross-Connection
Control and Hydraulic Research.

The testing procedures from the 10th Edition Manual of Cross-Connection
Control from the University of Southern California’s Foundation for Cross-
Connection Control and Hydraulic Research is incorporated by reference, and
may be examined at the Colorado Plumbing Board’s office at 1560 Broadway,
Suite 1350, Denver, Colorado 80202, during normal business hours, Monday
through Friday, except days designated as state holidays. Certified copies of the
10th Edition Manual of Cross-Connection Contro! shall be provided at cost, upon
request. The Board or the Board's staff will provide information regarding how the
10th Edition Manual of Cross-Connection Control may be examined for free at
the state public depository library. The 10th Edition Manual of Cross-Connection
Control is also available from the agency, organization or association originally
issuing the code, standard, guideline, or rule at: USC Foundation Office,
Research Annex 219, Los Angeles, CA 900838-7700 or (hitps://fccchr.usc.edu/).
This rule does not include any later amendments or editions of the code,
standard, guideline, or rule.

IPC Section 403.1 Minimum number of fixtures
Add a new sentence to the end of the section to read as follows:

Lavatory to water closet or urinal ratios in accordance with Table 403.1 shall be
maintained in all restrooms.

IPC Section 405.3.2 Public Lavatories
Add a new exception reading:
Exception: Lavatories located outside a toilet room located within a classroom

serving students from that classroom only. These toilet rooms and lavatories
shall not count toward the total fixture count required by Table 403.1.




CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCRT720-1

State Plumbing Board

s. [PC Section 410.4 Substitution.
Change first sentence to read:
Where restaurants (or spaces classified as an A2 occupancy) provide drinking
water in a container free of charge, drinking fountains shall not be required in
(these restaurants and A2 occupancies).

t. IPC Section 421.7 Shower head location
Add new section to read:
421.7 Shower head location. Showerheads shall be located on the sidewall of
shower compartments or be arranged so the shower head does not discharge
directly at the entrance to the compartment and the bather can adjust the valve
prior to stepping into the shower spray.
Exception: Showers of the roll in type installed in accordance with 2009 ANSI
A117.1.

u. IPC Section 421.8 Shower valve location
Add new section to read:
421.8 Shower valve location. A shower or tub/shower control valve shall be
installed only where the spout and/or shower head discharges into an approved
tub or shower compartment.
Exception: Emergency Showers.

V. IPC Section 425.3 Water closet seats
Add new exception to read:
Exception: Water closets installed in public restrooms for the purpose of
complying with accessible fixtures as required by Section 404 fitted with the
“AXS-Wingman Universal Design Water Closet Seat” having a closed front are
allowed.

w. IPC Section 504.6.1 Collection of Relief Valve Discharge

Add new section 504.6.1 to read:

504.6.1. Collection of Relief Valve Discharge. A means shall be provided to
capture the discharge from a relief valve and convey it to the sanitary drainage
system or exterior of the structure either by gravity or a pumped discharge.

Exceptions:
(1) Replacements for existing water heaters.
(2) Where a water sensing device wired to a normally closed solenoid valve

installed in the water supply piping to the heater is placed within the
water heater drain pan.




CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCRT720-1

State Plumbing Board

X.

aa.

bb.

IPC Section 504.6.1.1 Pumped discharge of relief valve collection
Add new Section 504.6.1 to read as follows:

504.6.1.1 Pumped discharge of relief valve collection. Pumps used to
discharge the clear water collection of relief valves shall have an operating
temperature equal to or exceeding that of the relief valve discharge temperature

and shall have a gpm rating equal to or greater than the discharge of the relief
valve.

[PC Section 504.7 Required pan.
Add new exception to read:

Replacements for water heaters that did not have a pan previously installed to
code in effect at the time of the original installation.

IPC Section 504.7 Required pan.
Add new sentence at end of the section to read:

Unless the pan is constructed of material having a flame spread index of 25 or
less and a smoke-developed index of 450 or less when tested in accordance with
ASTM E84 or UL 723.

IPC Section 605.15.2 Solvent cementing

Delete the exception in its entirety.

IPC Section 608.9.1 Signage required

Delete the section in its entirety and replace with:

(1) Plumbing fixtures flushed with nonpotable water shall be identified with
signage that reads as follows:

“Nonpotable water is used to flush this fixture. CAUTION:
NONPOTABLE WATER — DO NOT DRINK.”

In addition to the required wordage, the pictograph shown in figure
608.8.1 shall appear on the required signage.

(2) A permanent warning sign must also be visible at all fixtures from which
graywater is collected. The sign must state that:

‘WATER FROM THIS FIXTURE IS REUSED. CHEMICALS, EXCRETA,
PETROLEUM OILS AND HAZARDOUS MATERIALS MUST NOT BE
DISPOSED DOWN THIS DRAIN.”

(3) For both types of fixtures indicated in subsections 1.2(E)(1)(b){(1)(i) and
(ii), the words shall be legibly and indelibly printed on a tag or sign
constructed of corrosion-resistant waterproof material or shall be
indelibly printed on the fixture. The letters of the words shall be not less
than 0.5 inch (12.7 mm) in height and in colors in contrast to the
background on which they are applied.

10



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR720-1

State Plumbing Board

CC.

dd.

ee.

gg.

hh.

i

IPC Section 608.9.2 Distribution pipe labeling and marking

Delete the section verbiage and replace with:

Nonpotable distribution piping shall be purple in color or the piping shal! be
installed with a purple identification tape or wrap the entire length of the piping
and shall be embossed, or integrally stamped or marked, with the words:
“‘CAUTION: NONPOTABLE WATER ~ DO NOT DRINK".

IPC Section 608-17 Connections to the Potable Water Systems

Add new subsection 608.17.2.1 to read:

Section 608.17.2.1 essentially nontoxic fluid conditioning chemical.

When the conditioning chemical introduced is an essentially nontoxic transfer
fluid the potable supplier to the boiler shali, at a minimum, be equipped with a
backflow preventer with an intermediate atmospheric vent complying with ASSE
1012 or CSA B64.3.

IPC Section 608 Protection of potable water system

Add new subsection 608.17.11 to read:

Section 608.17.11 Connection to graywater system or reclaimed water system
The potable water system connection to a graywater system must be protected
against backflow by an air gap or reduced pressure principle backflow prevention
assembly.

IPC Section 705.10.2 Solvent cementing

Delete the exception in its entirety.

IPC Section 706.3. Installation of fittings

Add sentence to end of IPC Section 706.3:

fixture crosses will not be required to meet the exception of IPC Section706.3
IPC Section 7086.3.

Add sentence to end of IPC Section 706.3:

fixture crosses will not be required to meet the exception of {PC Section706.3
IPC Table 706.3 Fittings for change of direction

Delete footnotes a and b from the table.

IPC Section 708.1.3 Building drain and building sewer junction.

Add new sentence at the end of the section to read:

11



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS

State Plumbing Board

3 CCR720-1

kK.

When the cleanout is installed at the junction of the building drain and building
sewer, it shall be an approved two way fitting with a single riser not to exceed 4
feet in depth or a two riser cleanout using back to back combination fittings or
equal of schedule 40 material.

IPC Section 802.1.8 Domestic dishwashing machines

Add a new section to read:

Domestic dishwashing machines may be connected to a separately trapped
stand pipe provided with an air break (with drain hose secured to the underside

of the counter top) or air gap as shown in the illustration below. Refer to 2018
IPC 409.4 for additional waste connections.

mm.

nn.

i
1inch alr gap {,é"*‘“‘ i
. i
3 o
112" VIR r
or AAV under "'
countertop
an
Zip tie or hose clamp secures
i dishwasher hose
o with “candy tane fitting to
TET“:'.::‘:'EQ“" I standpipe
- R

e Dlairiﬂ" V J L—/
”.J
Y i

IPC Section 802.3 Installation
Delete the last sentence
IPC Section 802.4 Waste receptors.

Add new exception to read:

Exception: Where equipment is installed in a crawl space, a waste receptor shall

be allowed with an approved backwater valve installed.
IPC Section 903.1 Roof extensions

Insert 6 inches into the section so that it reads: “All open vent pipes that extend
through a roof shall be terminated at least 6 inches above the roof, except that
where a roof is to be used for any purpose other than weather protection, the
vent shall be extended at least seven feet (2134 mm) above the roof.”

12



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCRT720-1
State Plumbing Board

00. IPC Section 903.2 Frost Closure
Delete in its entirety.

pp. IPC Section 912.1 Horizontal wet vent permitted
Add a new exception to read:

Exception: Fixtures other than those considered to be bathroom group fixtures,
of equivalent drainage fixture units, may be included in the wet vented section
provided the total number of drainage fixture units does not exceed the total
number included in two bathroom groups and the fixtures not considered
bathroom fixtures are valued at one drainage fixture unit or less.

qq. IPC Section 1002.1 Fixture traps
Add new exception 5 to read:

Exception: 5. Trench and floor drains connected to a sand oil interceptor need
not be individually trapped provided the drain piping from the trench or floor
drains is turned down after entering the interceptor so the discharge pointis a
minimum of 4 inches below the standing water level of the interceptor.
. IPC Section 1003.1 Where required
Add the following Exception:
Exception: Where special regulations exist by the local waste water and/or
sanitation district into which the grease trap or interceptor effluent is transported
and/or treated. These regulations may supersede this requirement.
Ss. IPC.1003.2.3 Food waste disposers restriction.
Add exception to read:
When using a gravity interceptor equal to or greater than 500 gallon capacity.
tt. IPC Section 1101.3 Prohibited drainage
Add a new sentence to the end of the section reading:
Storm water from roof drains shall not discharge over public walkways except
when an approved grated trough or trench drain sized to accept the calculated
discharge is instailed in the walkway. The discharge shall be diverted vertically
from a height not greater than 12 inches to the grate.
Exception: Secondary drains.
uu. IPC Section 1301.2.2 Filtration Required Exception
Modify section 1301.2.2 Exemption reading:

Nonpotable water utilized for water closet and urinal flushing application shall be
filtered by a 100-micron or fine filter.

13



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR720-1
State Plumbing Board

Exception: Reclaimed water sources shall not be required to comply with these
requirements. Graywater treatment systems installed in accordance with Section
1302.6.1 do not need to meet additional filtration requirements.

vV, IPC Section 1301 General
Add new section 1301.3.1 reading:
1301.3.1. Distribution pipe labeling and marking

Nonpotable distribution piping shall comply with Section 608.8.2 as amended in
Rule 1.2(E)(1)(v).

WWw, IPC Section 1301.3.2 Signage required graywater treatment works.
Add section new section 1301.3.2 reading:
For each room that contains graywater treatment works components, a sign that
says “CAUTION GRAYWATER TREATMENT WORKS, DO NOT DRINK, DO
NOT CONNECT TO THE POTABLE DRINKING WATER SYSTEM. NOTICE:
CONTACT BUILDING MANAGEMENT BEFORE PERFORMING

ANY WORK ON THIS WATER SYSTEM" must be posted on any door providing
entrance to the room.

XX. [PC Section 1301 General
Add new figure 1301.4
1301.4 Typical Graywater Collection System

(This figure is typical only, not a schematic)

SANITARY SEWER
OPTIONAL MAKE UP WATER CONNECTION
WYE FITTING INSTALLED AS SHOWN TO PROVIOE OVERFLOW \
BYPASS FROM GRAYWATER EFLUEHY TO SAMTARY SEWES _\ | VENT
[P t
BT v t
. ks 1
GRAYWATER OVERFLOW LINE TO SARITARY SEWER v t )
l'\}" - ; { GRAVWATER GVERFLOW LINE TO SARITARY SEWER \
K ;
e !
Check Vale e T 10 SUBSURFALE
7 } . NTGATION wfly
- ! QVERFLOW To Water doset or Urinial g ¢ peememame
v t
GRAY VVATER & H K Disinfectant
sff;:::;‘s’?:;wsm INFLUENT : /"'INDIRECT DISCHARGE ,;:‘::?:: g
) i
1 " ! TO SANITARY
ﬂﬁ”&’:ﬁ;ﬂo“ GRAY WATER DRAINAGE 100 Micren or finer filter
9 . Theee wiy thutof divarter g RE SERVOIR v
BATHIUES, SHOWERS, vaive, drain to sanitary SYSTEM ores
CLOTHES WASHERS, e, Festry
AHD LAUNDRY YRAYS ~ fank
ONLY. TANK
T OFF VALY
DRA!P‘:\ M * i SHUT OFF VALYE
R
Z Pusng ¢
Typical layout showing required CHECK VALVE 0 mesh
jitar i W
elements for a graywater s/\— e SARUTASYSEVIER
llecti INDIRECT DISCHARGE b
coilection sytem TO SANITARY DRAINAGE PRESSURE GAGE
SYSTEM

14



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR 720-1
State Plumbing Board
vy IPC Section 1301 General
Add new figure 1301.5
1301.5 Typical graywater system for toilet and urinal flushing
SatiTARY SEWER

OPT-OHAL MAKE UR WATER CONNECTION

VIYE FITHING HISTALLED AS SHOWN T0) PROVIDE OVERFLOW
BYPASS FROM CRAYWATER £FLUEMT TO SAMITARY SEWER.

/ GRAYWATER QVERFLOW LINE TO SAMITARY SEWER
N’

VENT

GRAVIWAYER OVERFLOW LIME TO SANITARY SEWER

N

Check Valus 10 SUBSURFACE
RAGATION @
OVERFLOW To Vearer cloves pr Urinal B | prm—
GRA\{ ‘NATER K Uisinfectam
GeanaT LT INFLUENT /INDIRECT DISCHARGE ndbve b
: = M\_/|* TOSANITARY
lnl'\s\ﬁ:'t::?ﬁs;.nom ™ hutof divert GRAY WATER \ DRAINAGE 100 Micren or Hiner filter
BATHIUSS, SHOWERS, et gty RESERVOIR SYSTEM (7
CLOTHES WASHERS, oy tevsuie
AMD LAUNDRY TRAYS ~ ank
o -lggrilfl\l . SHUT o'rr VAWVE
Z Pumn
Typical layout showing required CHECK VALVE

elements for a graywater

SAMITARY SEWER

collection sytem

AL

INDIRECT DISCHARGE
TO SANITARY DRAINAGE
SYSTEM

PRESSURE GAGE

L3

15



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR720-1
State Plumbing Board

zz. IPC Section 1301 General

Add new figure 1301.6

1301.6 Typical graywater system for disbursed subsurface irrigation system

R Q‘) Sarxtaty

RUETHE LR ]
T

Ak Vet |

i apsatas

Ve g ayvinters £loriage Yank
Wit Prasgs
TR (P T i mmmmen ey
e e Treats
Diriairt I W
[~ ihye
Yo sandmy symlens

Py

s

rRTage Syslem

N S
e Sartitary $ainagge

Lheck SR

Vah

16



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR720-1
State Plumbing Board

aaa.

IPC Section 1301 General

Add new figure 1301.7

1301.7 Typical graywater system for mulch basin subsurface irrigation

bbb

CCC.

To sanilary
teninsge Sy

Barslary dramage

sy 5igTn

IPC Section 1301.9.2 Materials Exception Add section

1301.9.2 Exemption reading:

Exemption. Tanks are not required if the graywater use is comprised of only
subsurface irrigation and flows into a mulch basin system, where the mulch basin
volume is three times the anticipated average daily flow.

IPC Section 1301.9.5 Overflow

Delete the section verbiage and replace with:

17



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR720-1

State Plumbing Board

ddd.

eee.

ggg.

hhh.

I

The storage tank shall be equipped with an overflow pipe having a diameter not
less than that shown in Table 606.5.4. The overflow pipe shall be protected from
insects or vermin. The overflow drain shall not be equipped with a shutoff valve
and shall discharge into the sanitary sewer either directly, or indirectly with a trap
in the drain line to keep odors from escaping the tank. A cleanout shall be
provided on each overflow pipe in accordance with Section 708.

IPC Section 1301.9.8 Draining of tanks

Delete the text “shall discharge as required for overflow pipes and”. Replace it
with: shall discharge into the sanitary sewer either directly, or indirectly with a
trap in the drain line to keep odors from escaping the tank

IPC Section 1301.11 Trenching Requirements

Delete in its entirety.

IPC Section 1301.12 Outdoor Outlet Access

Delete in its entirety.

IPC Section 1302.1 General

Add a sentence to the end of the section saying:

All plumbing systems utilizing nonpotable water reuse systems shall have a
reduced pressure backflow preventer device installed at the water service
entrance immediately downstream of the building water service shut off valve.
IPC Section 1302.5 Filtration

Add a new sentence {o the end of the section saying:

1302.5 Filtration: Graywater used for dispersed subsurface irrigation system
requires a cartridge filter. The cartridge filter must be a minimum of sixty mesh

located between the storage tank and the irrigation system.

Exemption. Filtration is not required for mulch basin subsurface irrigation
systems.

IPC Section 1302.6.1 Graywater used for fixture flushing
Add a new sentence to the end of the section reading:

Graywater used for toilet and urinal flushing shall be dyed with blue or green food
grade vegetable dye and be visibly distinct from potable water.

IPC Section 1302.7.3 Overflow

Add a new Section 1302.7.3 that reads:

18



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR 720-1

State Plumbing Board

kkk.

mmm.

nnn.

000.

1302.7.3 Overflow. Storage tank for on-site nonpotable systems must include an
overflow line without a shut off valve. The overflow line shall be connected to the
sanitary sewer indirectly. The overflow line must be the same or larger diameter
line than the tank influent fine. The overflow line connected indirectly must be
trapped to prevent the escape of gas vapors from the tank

IPC Section 1302.7.4 Venting
Add a new Section 1302.7.4 that reads:

1302.7.4 Venting. Storage tank for on-site nonpotable systems must be vented.
Indoor tanks must be vented to the atmosphere outside the building or connected
to the plumbing vent system.

IPC Section 1302.7.5 Tank Drains
Add a new Section 1302.7.5 that reads:

1302.7.5 Tank Drains. Storage tank for on-site nonpotable systems must include
a valved drain. The drain shall be indirectly connected to the sanitary sewer. The
tank drainline must be the same or larger diameter line than the tank influent line.

IPC Section 1302.8.1 Bypass Valve

Change the section heading and section verbiage to read:
Section 1302.8.1 System Bypass

Delete the section verbiage and replace with:

One three-way diverter valve listed and labeled to NSF 50 or other approved
device shall be installed on collection piping upstream of any graywater treatment
equipment, as applicable, to divert untreated on-site reuse sources to the
sanitary sewer to allow servicing and inspection of the system. Bypass valves
shall be installed downstream of fixture traps and vent connections. Bypass
valves shall be marked to indicate the direction of flow, connection graywater
treatment works, storage tank and graywater subsurface irrigation systems.
Bypass valves shall be installed in accessible locations. Two shutoff valves shall
not be installed to serve as a bypass valve. In addition to the bypass valve a
series of drainage fittings shall be installed in the collection piping upstream of
the bypass valve in a configuration that will allow the graywater from the
plumbing fixtures to automatically flow directly into the sanitary sewer system in
the event the filter or other parts of the collection system become clogged to the
point of not aliowing the effluent free flow through the system. The overflow line
connected to the sanitary sewer shall be equipped with a backwater valve.

IPC Section 1303 Nonpotable rainwater collection and distribution systems
Delete in its entirety.
IPC Chapter 14 Subsurface landscape irrigation systems

Delete in its entirety.

19



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR 720-1

State Plumbing Board

2. Revisions and Exceptions to the International Residential Code Part VIl incorporated as
the Colorado Plumbing Code

a.

IRC Section R202 Definitions
Add new definition to read as follows:

Multipurpose Residential Fire Sprinkler System. A Multipurpose Residential
Fire Sprinkler System includes the domestic water distribution piping and the fire
sprinkler piping which shall be a part of and connect to the cold water distribution
piping at any point.

IRC Section R202 Definitions
Add new definitions to read:

Direct Supervision. Direct supervision means that the supervising licensed
master plumber, journeyman plumber, or residential plumber is physically
present at the same physical addresses listed on the permits and where the
apprentice is working or no more than five minutes distance from the apprentice.

IRC Section R202 Definitions
Add new definition to read as follows:

Trap drain. That portion of horizontal piping between the weir of a trap and the
point where it intersects with its vent.

IRC Section R202 Definitions
Delete the definition and replace with:

Fixture drain. That portion of a plumbing drainage system that connects the trap
drain to any other drain pipe receiving the discharge from one or more plumbing
fixtures.

IRC Section R202 Definitions
Add new definition to read as follows:

Manufactured Housing Hookup-Sewer. That portion of drainage piping and
fittings connecting a single point of drainage pipe discharge from the factory
installed plumbing of a manufactured home to the sanitary sewer riser under the
set home. (More than a single connection to the home drainage piping shall be
considered “plumbing” as defined in section 12-155-103, C.R.S., and subject to
all provisions of Article 155 of Title 12).

IRC Section R202 Definitions
Add new definition to read as follows:
Manufactured Housing Hookup-Water. That portion of piping and fittings

connecting a single point of water supply from the factory installed water supply
pipe of a manufactured home to the potable water riser under the set home.

20



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR 720-1

State Plumbing Board

IRC Section 202 Definitions

Delete the definition and replace with:

Reclaimed Water. Domestic wastewater that has received secondary treatment
by a domestic wastewater treatment works (centralized system or a localized
system) and such additional treatment as to enable the wastewater to meet the
standards for approved uses.

IRC Section P2503.5.1 Rough Plumbing

Delete the words “for piping systems other than plastic”.

IRC Section P2503.6 Shower liner test

Delete in its entirety.

IRC Section P2503.7 Water supply system testing

Delete the words “for piping systems other than plastic”

IRC Section P2503.5.2 Finished plumbing.

Delete 2, 2.1, and 2.2

IRC Section P2601.2 Connection to drainage system

Delete the Exception in its entirety.

IRC Section P2605.2 Thermal expansion tanks.

Add new section P2605.2 to read:

P2605.2 Thermal expansion tanks. A thermal expansion tank shall be supported
in accordance with the manufacturer’s instructions. Thermal expansion tanks
shall not be supported by the piping that connects to such tanks.

IRC Section P2603.3 Protection against corrosion.

Delete section in its entirety and replace with:

IRC P2603.3 Protection against corrosion. Piping except for, for cast iron, ductile
iron, and galvanized steel shall not be placed in direct contact with steel framing
members. Piping shall not be placed in direct contact with concrete or cinder
walls and floors, other masonry, and corrosive soil. Where sheathing is used to
prevent direct contact, the sheathing shall have a thickness of not less than .025
inch {.64 mm). Where sheathing protects piping that penetrates concrete or
masonry walls or floors, the sheathing shall be installed in a manner that allows
movement of the piping within the sheathing.

IRC Section P2705.1 General

Add new exception to read:

21



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR720-1

State Plumbing Board

Exception: Lavatory clearance from its center to any sidewall or partition may be
reduced to a minimum of twelve inches.

q. IRC P2706.1 General (waste receptors)
Add new exception to read:
Exception: Where equipment is installed in a craw! space, a waste receptor shall
be allowed with an approved backwater valve installed.

r. IRC Section P2708.5 Shower head location
Add new section P2708.5 to read:
P2708.5 Shower head location. Shower heads shall be so located on the
sidewall of shower compartments or be arranged so the shower head does not
discharge directly at the entrance to the compartment and the bather can adjust
the valve prior to stepping into the shower spray.

S. IRC Section P2717.3 Dishwasher drain

Add new section to read:

IRC Section P2717.3 Dishwasher drain. Dishwashers may drain into a
standpipe complying with Section P2706.2 as shown in the following illustration.
The standpipe shall be provided with an air break (with drain hose secured to the
underside of the counter top) or air gap as shown in the illustration below.

1 inch 2ir gop (’L,é"""”’”
e,
Y

%'(4
& Y. . ,

3 ;

T

or AAV under £
counter top

#

¢
£

£
£

1-1/2" Sink Drain~

t.

o

.

Swrve ]

-j-w-q:':.:::

£

3 Zip tie or hose clamp secures
dishwasher hose

with “candy tane fitting to
standplpe

»
rn“’ s

e
.

IRC Section P2801.6 Required pan.

Add new exception to read:

22



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR 720-1
State Plumbing Board

Exception: Replacements for water heaters that did not have a pan previously
installed due to code in force at the time of instaliation.

u. IRC Section P2803.6.2 Collection of Relief Valve Discharge
Add new section P2803.6.2 to read:
P2803.6.2 Collection of Relief Valve Discharge. A means shall be provided to

capture the discharge from a relief valve and convey it to the sanitary drainage
system or exterior of the structure either by gravity or a pumped discharge.

Exceptions:
(1) Replacements for existing water heaters.
(2) Where a water sensing device'wired to a normally closed solenoid valve

installed in the water supply piping to the heater, is placed within the
water heater drain pan.

V. IRC Section P2803.6.2.1 Pumped discharge of relief valve collection
Add new Section P2803.6.2.1 to read:
P2803.6.2.1 Pumped discharge of relief valve collection. Pumps used to
discharge the clear water collection of relief valves shall have an operating
temperature equal to or exceeding that of the relief valve discharge temperature

and shall have a gpm rating equal to or greater than the discharge of the relief
valve.

w. IRC Section P2901.1 Potable water required
Delete the last sentence of the section.

X. IRC Section P2901.1.2.1 Signage required
Delete the section in its entirety and replace with:

Plumbing fixtures flushed with nonpotable water shall be identified with signage
that reads as follows:

“Nonpotable water is used to flush this fixture. CAUTION: NONPOTABLE
WATER - DO NOT DRINK.”

In addition to the required wordage, the pictograph shown in figure P2901.2.1
shall appear on the required signage.

y. IRC New Section P2901.1.2.4
Add new Section P2901.1.2.4 to read:

Graywater used for toilet and urinal flushing shall be dyed with blue or green food
grade vegetable dye and be visibly distinct from potable water.

23



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR720-1

State Plumbing Board

aa.

bb.

CC.

dd.

ee.

IRC Section P2901.2.2 Distribution pipe labeling and marking

Delete the section verbiage and replace with:

Nonpotable distribution piping shall be purple in color or the piping shall be
installed with a purple identification tape or wrap the entire length of the piping
and shall be embossed, or integrally stamped or marked, with the words:
*CAUTION: NONPOTABLE WATER ~ DO NOT DRINK”.

IRC Section P2902.5 Protection of potable water connections

Add new subsection P2902.5.1.1 to read:

Section P2902.5.1.1 Essentially nontoxic fluid conditioning chemical.

When the conditioning chemical introduced is an essentially nontoxic transfer
fluid the potable supplier to the boiler shall, at a minimum, be equipped with a
backflow preventer with an intermediate atmospheric vent complying with ASSE
1012 or CSA B64.3.

IRC New Section P2902.5.6 Protection of potable water system

Add new subsection P2902.5.6 to read:

Section P2902.5.6 Connection to graywater system or reclaimed water system
The potable water system connection to a graywater system or reclaimed water
system must be protected against backflow by an air gap or reduced pressure
principle backflow prevention assembly.

IRC Section P2903.9.1 Service valve.

Delete the words "with provision for drainage such as a bleed orfice or installation
of a separate drain valve"

[RC Section P2904 General
Delete in its entirety and replace with:

P2904.1 General. Where installed, residential fire sprinkler systems, or portions
thereof, shall be in accordance with NFPA 13D or Section P2904, which shall be
considered equivalent to NFPA 13D. Section P2904 shall apply to multipurpose
wet-pipe sprinkler systems that do not include the use of antifreeze. A
multipurpose fire sprinkler system shall supply domestic water to both fire
sprinklers and plumbing fixtures. A backflow preventer shall not be required to
separate the sprinkler system from the water distribution system.

IRC Section P2910 Graywater Recycling Systems
Add new Figure P2810.4 Typical Graywater Collection system.

(This figure is typical only, not a schematic)

24



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR 720-1
State Plumbing Board

SANITARY SEWER
GRTIONAL KIAKE UP WATIR CONNICTION

WYVE FITTING INSTALLED RS SHOWN TO PAOVILE OVERFLOW rd
BYPASS FROM GRATWAYER EFLLENT YO SATATARY SEWER, - iOVENT
: 1
. ¥
GRAYWATER OVERFLOW UNE TO SANITARY SEWER ?‘\\l" 2 :
1 = : e GRATWATER OVERFLOW LINE TO SANITARY SEWER \
z
/ ; wrme :
Check Vstue B e ! TO SUBSURFACE
& ' OVERFLOW Yo Waates doset or rinal ey IRRGATION me
1]
GRAY WATER Z ! K Disinfectant
: 2
SRATATER sriueT INFLUENT /" INDIRECT DISCHARGE yrdfre
— \ J l TO SANITARY
f’is"crr’:;ﬁ‘:;gom Threa way shutoff divarces  mge GRAY WATER DRAINAGE 300 Micren ot finer fltar
BATHTURS, SHOWERS, velue, drain to senitsry RESERVOIR SYSTEM
CLOTHES WASHERS, sewar, Presavie
AND LAUNDHRY TRAYS g i
omLY. . TANK <
DRAIN . SHWO;FVA\VE SHUT OFF VALVE
~><H — IO 0
Z Pump L3
Typical layout showing required CHECK VALVE O Ot e
elements for a graywater \/-\ fter
Hecti INDIRECT DISCHARGE o dd
coilection sytem TO SANITARY DRAINAGE PRESSURE GAGE
SYSTEM
ff. IPC Section 2910.1 Scope

Add a sentence to the end of the section saying:

All plumbing systems utilizing nonpotable water reuse systems shall have a
reduced pressure backflow preventer device installed at the water service
entrance immediately downstream of the building water service shut off valve.

gg. IRC Section P2910.2.2 Filtration Required Exception
Modify section Exemption to read:

P2910.2.2 Fiitration Required. Nonpotable water utilized for water closet and
urinal flushing application shall be filtered by a 100-micron or fine filter.

Exception: Reclaimed water sources shall not be required to comply with these
requirements. Graywater treatment systems installed in accordance with Section
P2911.6.1 do not need to meet additional filtration requirements.

25



3 CCR720-1

CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS
State Plumbing Board

hh. IRC Section P2910 Graywater recycling systems

Add new figure Section 2910.5

Gravavaler ne
frizm budding

7 Hom

Cvarttow by

Vet
v Fotasle
ltting Sanzary WAL t'
.\ - drmnfgc syslem makeup FAY ~
Check . ’
vae
Backfiow
evention
device
unnal

Hushing

‘i{ I overdiow
¥ with p-trap

SO

eetant ) ,
D'S'r_n A| Indireclly discharge o 7
| santary drainage A
Three-Way Vaive b Graywaer i ™,
i .. s ey 14 *
[ : eatment Treated graywate
P L
A : NSF 350 slarage tank (a) Alternatve foeavor )
fCgraywater . equipment U for disinfeczant |
reatment | :
0
!
- | Valve ‘L o V
To sani : ) LA
T0 sariary ¥ indrecily discharyge 1o AN~y .
drairage system \l/ Pump \<
)
N . ohE
s : i
antary drainage : |
Check S“"(‘Sf,’;fc;z:m“"' et 3
valve Y Oanoral A
G [ —y
preEssure ." freaied /
ank ! oaresemntar f
a Swerane ank may be installed bofore NSF 350 rearnent. / an:’;fﬂlcf f
g f !
i { sutsurines

Unupated grajgwvater may b stored far ne graater than 74 hours
/ rrgaton

26




CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR 720-1
State Plumbing Board

ii IRC Section P2910 Graywater recycling systems
Add New Figure Section 2910.6

2910.6 Typical graywater system for disbursed subsurface irrigation system

¥
"
) ,_‘% et |
R, |

{ I ?@eﬁﬂ«m
e B g el thid]

5
y i /l i
T way vadee

g

Graywabi!

Ta giisyasler Tl staraoe bk
eatmerd
Cirain ' o
Vahee
Yo santary &5 = P
GTATHIGE SyYEliTm E/ Barelaty 1
syslam
N »
C"’ « Saritary drainage
e Bysinm
Valve

27



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR720-1
State Plumbing Board

i IRC Section P2910 General
Add new figure Section 2910.7

2910.7 Typical graywater system for mulch basin subsurface irrigation

e

Thoessway walen

[ =i

Py Hfainage
el

L

Galand

kk. IRC Section 2910.9.3 Materials
Add section Exemption to read:

Exemption. Tanks are not required if the graywater use is comprised of only
subsurface irrigation and flows into a muich basin system, where the mulch basin
volume is three times the anticipated average daily flow.

28



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR 72041

State Plumbing Board

mm.

nn.

00.

pp.

IRC Section 2911.5 Filtration
Delete the section in its entirety and replace with:

P2811.5.1 Filtration. Graywater used for dispersed subsurface irrigation system
requires a cartridge filter. The cartridge filter must be a minimum of sixty mesh
located between the storage tank and the irrigation system. If a pump is being
used to pressurize the graywater distribution system the filter must be located
after the pump. Filters shall be accessible for inspection and maintenance. Filters
shall utilize a pressure gauge or other approved method to provide indication
when a filter requires servicing or replacement. Filters shall be installed with
shutoff valves immediately upstream and downstream to allow for isolation during
maintenance.

Exemption. Filtration is not required for mulch basin subsurface irrigation
systems.

IRC Section P2911.7.6 Overflow

Add a new Section P2911.7.6 that reads:

P2911.7.6 Overflow. Storage tank for on-site nonpotable systems must inciude
an overflow line without a shut off valve. The overflow line shall be connected to
the sanitary sewer indirectly. The overflow line must be the same or larger
diameter line than the tank influent line. The overflow line connected indirectly
must be trapped to prevent the escape of gas vapors from the tank.

[RC Section P2911.7.4 Venting

Add a new Section P2911.7.4 that reads:

P2911.7.4 Venting. Storage tank for on-site nonpotable systems must be vented
to the atmosphere or connected to the piumbing system vent piping.

RC Section P2911.7.5 Draining of tanks

Add a new Section P2911.7.5 that reads:

P2911.7.5 Draining of tanks. Storage tank for on-site nonpotable systems must
include a valved drain. The drain line shall be connected to the sanitary sewer
either directly or indirectly. The tank drain line must be the same or larger
diameter line than the tank influent line.

IRC Section P2911.8.1 Bypass valve

Section P2911.8.1 System Bypass

Delete the section verbiage and replace with:

29



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR720-1

State Plumbing Board

qq.

r.

SS.

t.

uu.

VV.

WWw.

XX.

One three-way diverter valve listed and labeled to NSF 50 or other approved
device shall be installed on collection piping upstream of any graywater treatment
equipment, as applicable, to divert untreated on-site reuse sources to the
sanitary sewer to allow servicing and inspection of the system. Bypass valves
shall be installed downstream of fixture traps and vent connections. Bypass
valves shall be marked to indicate the direction of flow, connection to graywater
treatment works, storage tank and graywater subsurface irrigation system..
Bypass valves shall be installed in accessible locations. Two shutoff valves shall
not be installed to serve as a bypass valve. In addition to the bypass valve a
series of drainage fittings shall be installed in the collection piping upstream of
the bypass valve in a configuration that will allow the graywater from the
plumbing fixtures to automatically flow directly into the sanitary sewer system in
the event the filter or other parts of the collection system become clogged to the
point of not allowing the effluent free flow through the system. The overfiow line
connected to the sanitary sewer shall be equipped with a backwater valve.

IRC Section P3003.9.2 Solvent cementing

Delete exception in its entirety.

IRC Table P3005.1 Fittings for changes in direction

Delete footnotes a and b from the table.

IRC Section P3005.2.3 Building drain and building sewer junction.

Add new sentence at the end of the section to read:

When the cleanout is installed at the junction of the building drain and building
sewer, It shall be an approved two way fitting with a single riser not to exceed 4

feet in depth or a two riser cleanout using back to back combination fittings of
schedule 40 material.

IRC Section P3008.1 Where required (backwater valves)

Delete section in its entirety and replace with:

Backwater valves shall be installed where waste receptors are located in a crawl
space for the purpose of receiving condensate discharge from equipment located
in that crawl space. Refer to new exception for 802.4

IRC Section P3009 Subsurface landscape irrigation systems

Delete in its entirety.

IRC Section P3103.2 Frost closure

Delete in its entirety.

IRC Section P3108.1 Horizontal wet vent permitted

Add a new exception to read:

30



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR 720-1

State Plumbing Board

Exception: Fixtures other than those considered to be bathroom group fixtures,
of equivalent drainage fixture units, may be included in the wet vented section
provided the total number of drainage fixture units does not exceed the total
number included in two bathroom groups and the fixtures not considered
bathroom fixtures are valued at one drainage fixture unit or less.

3. Revisions and exceptions to the International Fuel Gas Code incorporated as the
Colorado Fuel Gas Code

a.

[FGC Section 101.1 Title

Delete in its entirety.

IFGC Section 101.2.2 Piping Systems

Delete the words “and maintenance” from the end of the last sentences.
IFGC Section 101.2.4 Systems, appliances and equipment outside the scope.
Delete 13 from the list.

tFGC Section 303.3. Prohibited locations

Delete the words “toilet rooms” from the section.

[FGC Section 310.1.1 CSST

Add a new exception to read:

Exception: Conductive Jacketed Corrugated Stainless Steel Tubing (CSST) with
arc resistant jacketing complying with Listing LC1024 from the ICC Evaluation

Service shali be installed per the manufacturer’s installation instructions and the
listing’s requirements.

IFGC Section 403.10.5 Welded joints

Add new section 403.10.5 to read:

403.10.5 Welded Joints. Welded joints shall be performed by a person holding a
valid certificate of competency based on the requirements of the ANSI/ASME
Boiler and Pressure Vessel Code, Section [X, Brazing and Welding
Qualifications. Welded joints shall comply with ASTM 139,

IFGC Section 406.1 Inspection, Testing, and Purging

Add a new sentence to the end of the section reading:

Inspection and pressure testing shall apply to all temporary installations
connected to a primary or temporary fuel gas source, natural or LP gas, for the
purpose of supplying temporary heat.

IFGC Section 409.5.3 Located at manifold

Delete in its entirety.

31



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR720-1

State Plumbing Board

IFGC 409.6 Shutoff valve for laboratories
Add new subsection 409.6.1 to read

409.6.1 Electric Solenoid Valve. A remotely located electric solenoid
emergency shutoff valve may be used for compliance to Section 409.6, when all
the following requirements are met.

(1) The emergency control shutoff “panic button” shall be readily accessible,
located within the laboratory space served, adjacent to the egress door

from the space and shall be identified by approved signage stating “Gas
Shutoff”.

(2) The gas solenoid valve shall be a “normally closed” type valve with a
manual reset.

IFGC Section 503.4.1 Plastic Piping,
Add new sentence to the end of the section saying:

Where installed as an exhaust vent for a gas fired water heater, the new plastic
pipe shall be tested with 5 psi maximum air pressure at the time of inspection
prior to being connected to the water heater,

4, Revisions and exceptions to the International Residential Code Chapter 24 Fuel Gas
incorporated as the Colorado Fuel Gas Code

a.

IRC Section G2414.10.5 Welded joints

Add new section G2414.10.5 Welded joints to read:

Welded joints. Welded joints shall be performed by a person holding a valid
certificate of competency based on the requirements of the ANSI/ASME Boiler
and Pressure Vessel Code, Section IX, Brazing and Welding Qualifications.
Welded joints shall comply with ASTM 139.

IRC Section G2411.1 Gas Pipe Bonding

Add a new exception to read:

Exception: Conductive Jacketed Corrugated Stainless Steel Tubing (CSST) with
arc resistant jacketing complying with Listing 1.C1024 from the ICC Evaluation

Service shall be installed per the manufacturer's installation instructions and the
listing's requirements.

IRC Section G2420.5.3 (Shutoffs) Located at manifolds
Delete in its entirety.
IRC G2427.4.1 Plastic Piping,

Add new sentence to the end of the section saying:

32



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR 720-1

State Plumbing Board
Where installed as an exhaust vent for a gas fired water heater, the new plastic
pipe shall be tested with 5 psi maximum air pressure at the time of inspection
prior to being connected to the water heater.
1.3 APPRENTICE REGISTRATION AND RECORDKEEPING
A. Registration
1. The Board may require the supervising plumbing contractor of a plumbing apprentice to
provide information verifying the apprentice’s record of employment and practical
experience, including but not limited to a written attestation from the responsible master
plumber verifying that the apprentice has been performing plumbing work during any
period the apprentice was not registered. Supervising plumbing contractor of apprentices
shall cooperate with any request from the Board pursuant to this Rule and furnish such
information or assistance as the Board may request.

2. An individual that holds an active residential plumber’s license and is working on a
commercial job site must be registered as an apprentice.

3. An employer who fails to timely register an apprentice as required by section 12-155-
108(2)(a), C.R.S., and this Rule shall be subject to disciplinary action pursuant to
sections 12-155-113(1) and 12-20-404, C.R.S.

B. Recordkeeping. Supervising plumbing contractors shall maintain employment records or work
reports for their apprentices in order to provide experience verification. Such records or reports
shall accurately document the number of hours and months the apprentice performed plumbing
work and shall specifically reflect exact dates of employment. These records shall be provided to
the apprentice upon his/her request or termination or resignation of an apprentice.

1.4 APPLICATIONS AND LICENSING

A. Applications for License Examinations or Registrations.

Note: Applications received after December 1, 2019 must pass the required examination before
submitting application to the Board with the required experience and education.

1. Submission. All applications for license examinations or registrations shall be submitted
to the Division of Professions and Occupations.

2. Incomplete Application. An application for a license by examination or endorsement or
a registration submitted without all required fees and documentation will be considered
incomplete. Incomplete applications will be retained for one year from the date originally
received, after which applicants shall begin the process again including payment of the
application fee.

3. Documentation for Plumbing License Examination. Any applicant for the residential,
journeyman, or master plumber's license exam shall furnish evidence as to his or her
training and experience to qualify for the examination by:

a. A record of employment and/or as an apprentice doing plumbing work, exact
dates so employed, and, at time of application, submission of original
documented written evidence, verified by the master license holder or registered
plumbing contractor

33



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCRT720-1

State Plumbing Board

If training and experience were obtained outside the State of Colorado, the
applicant shall provide the Board with documented, written evidence verified by
the employer of actual work performed.

If training and experiences were obtained all or in part from an accredited high
school vocational technical training course, community college, or trade school
program, a transcript from the accredited high school vocational technical training
course, community college or trade school verifying completion of the program
shall be submitted with the application. The program length shall be a minimum
of two years. Such education may replace actual field experience under a
licensed master as follows: one hour of classroom training equals one hour of on
the job training up to a maximum of one year, with 2000 hours equaling one year.

If training and experiences were obtained all or in part from military training in
plumbing work, detail and submit such for evaluation with the application. Such
experience may replace actual field experience under a licensed master as

follows: one month for every six months' training or experience up to a maximum
of one year.

The hours of practical experience required to qualify for examinations are:
(1) Residential Plumber 3,400
(2) Journeyman Plumber 6,800

(3) Master Plumber 8,500

4. Expiration. An approved applicant for licensure by examination who does not take the
examination within one year from the original approval date will be required to submit an
updated application and any supplemental documentation.

5. Documentation for Water Conditioning Installer, Principal, or Contractor. Any
applicant for registration shall furnish evidence upon request as to his or her training and
experience to qualify for registration.

a.

Water Conditioning Installer.

(1) Any applicant for a water conditioning installer registration shall possess
the following qualifications and experience:

(a) Knowledge of water quality, water quality issues, and problems
common to water sources.

(b) Knowledge of the analysis and treatment of water for impurities,
water softening, drinking water options, reverse osmosis and
water filtration.

(c) Knowledge of common water treatment system operations,
including water softening, reverse osmosis, and water filtration.

(d) Knowledge of hydraulics fundamentals including plumbing
distribution system operations, pressure loss and cross
connections, effects on public safety, flow rates, and code
requirements for safe drainage.

34



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR720-1

State Plumbing Board

(e) Knowledge of recommended practices, including legal and
ethical considerations in the water treatment industry.

f) Knowledge of disinfection methods, including standard
disinfectants and methods, water contamination problems, UV
and chemical disinfection systems, disinfection of private water
sources, and final barrier water treatment.

(9) Knowledge of water analysis fundamentals including selection of
tests for analysis, reading and interpreting water analyses, and
conducting and interpreting water tests.

(h) Experience with water conditioning installation.

(i) Knowledge of general installation principles including POE and
POU water treatment systems, including related safety
considerations.

(2) Any applicant for a water conditioning installer registration shall possess
and maintain an active Certified Installer (Cl} certification from the Water
Quality Association or an equivalent certification as approved by the
Plumbing Board.

b. Water Conditioning Principal.

(1) Any applicant for a water conditioning principal registration shall possess
the following qualifications and experience:

(a) All items listed in the previous subsection 1.4(A)(5)(a)(1) of these
Rules.

(b) Knowledge of common water problems including: nitrates,
bacterial contamination, iron/manganese/hydrogen sulfide, and
arsenic.

(c) Ability to design water treatment systems to address regional
water issues such as Endocrine Disruptors and Pharmaceuticals,
Radium/Barium/Radioactive Decay, and Tannins.

(d) Knowledge of methods to calculate pressure loss in distribution
systems.

(2) Principal. Any applicant for a water conditioning principal registration
shall possess and maintain an active Certified Installer (Cl) certification
and an active Certified Water Specialist (CWS) or Master Water
Specialist (MWS) certification from the Water Quality Association or an
equivalent certification or certifications as approved by the Plumbing
Board.

c. Water Conditioning Contractor. Any applicant for a water conditioning contractor

must be or employ full time a water conditioning principal.

35



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR720-1

State Plumbing Board

Water Conditioning Contractor's Loss of Water Conditioning Principal. A water
conditioning contractor that, for any reason, loses the services of the water
conditioning principal will be allowed twenty days in which to hire another water
conditioning principal. If another water conditioning principal has not been hired
during that period, the water conditioning contractor registration will be placed
into a “Need WC Principal Hire-Cannot Practice” status until such time as a
principal has been hired, and the appropriate fee paid.

B. Licenses and Registration Issuance.

1.

C. Disapproval

1.

Issuance. Residential, journeymen or master piumber licenses will be issued upon
successful passing of the respective examination. Water conditioning registrations shall
be issued upon application approval based on proper documentation as outlined in
1.4(A)(5) of these Rules.

a.

By endorsement. Licensees from another state may be eligible for licensure by
endorsement providing that the applicant meets the requirements of section 12-
165-116, C.R.S., and all of the following conditions:

(1) Completion of a state or federally approved or registered apprenticeship
program, or completion of the required years and type of experience for
the comparable license.

(2) Successful completion of a comparable state plumbing examination
based on the current or previous edition of the plumbing code adopted
by the Board.

(3) Currently holds an active license by the endorsing state.

Reconsideration. An applicant requesting reconsideration of a Board action concerning
a disapproval of an application or license by endorsement or requesting a personal
interview before the Board, shall submit the request in writing, accompanied by additional
information or documentation. This request shall be submitted within forty-five days of the
date on which the Board made the decision. The Board may not consider requests filed

thereafter.

D. [Repealed eff.06/14/2020]

E. Renewal and Reinstatement (Effective July 1, 2020)

1.

Renewal.

A licensee or registrant shall have a sixty-day grace period after the expiration of
the license or registration to renew such license or registration without having to
submit a reinstatement application. During this grace period a delinquency fee
will be charged for late renewals.

A licensee or registrant who does not renew his or her license or registration
shall be ineligible to practice until such license or registration is reinstated. if the
licensee or registrant practices with an expired license or registration, the Board
may impose disciplinary actions.

36



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR 720-1

State Plumbing Board

2. Reinstatement. An expired license or registration may be reinstated by submitting a

reinstatement application, paying the current reinstatement fee, and meet the appropriate
requirements below.

a.

Expired for More Than Sixty Days But Less Than Two bYears. If the license or
registration has expired for more than sixty days but less than two years, the
applicant must provide evidence of completion, since applicant’'s most recent
licensing event (original; license, renewal, or reinstatement) preceding the
application for reinstatement, of eight hours of continuing education, as defined in
Board Rule 1.4(E)(3).

Expired for More Than Two Years. If the license has been expired for more than
two years, pursuant to section 12-155-112(2)(b)(ll), C.R.S. the applicant must
demonstrate competency to practice by satisfactorily passing the State plumbing
examination. In the case of Water Conditioning Installers and Water Conditioning
Principals, registrants shall re-affirm that their certifications per board Rule
1.4(A)(5) are current and active.

3. Continuing Education Requirements

a.

Statutory Basis. Pursuant to section 12-155-1 12(3)(b) C.R.S, the Board shall
adopt rules establishing continuing education requirements and standards that a
licensee shall demonstrate in order to renew a license on or after May 1, 2021.
Such requirements and standards must include course work related to the code,
including core competencies as determined by the board.

Basis of Requirements. As established by the Colorado General Assembly, the
regulatory authority of the Board is to establish continuing education standards to
renew, reinstate, or reactivate a license and the documentation necessary to
demonstrate compliance.

Definitions

) Core Competencies: Core Competencies are technical and professional
subjects, related to the practice of plumbing work, which the Board
deems necessary to safeguard the public.

(2) Inactive Status: A licensee is not required to comply with continuing
education requirements to renew a license in inactive status. An
individual whose license is in inactive status is prohibited by law from
practicing as a licensed plumber.

(3) Code: Code for the safe installation of plumbing installation, plumbing
materials, conservation, medical gas, sanitary drainage systems, and
solar plumbing.

4) Attesting Providers List: A publically available list containing continuing
education providers that have attested their courses and instructors meet
all the requirements of Board Rule 1.4(E)(3)(d) and 1.4(E)(3)(e). Credit
may be earned by a licensee by completing a course from a provider on
this list. However, licensee are responsible for ensure the providers they
choose, meet the requirements of the CE requirements in Board Rule
1.4(EX3).

37



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR720-1

State Plumbing Board

d. Reguirements

(1

(2)

)

(4)

Each renewal cycle after May 2021, or upon the completion of the first
renewal of a license thereafter, a licensee in active status shall complete
eight hours of continuing education for every twelve months that have
passed after the later of the last date of renewal or reinstatement in order
to renew a license to perform plumbing work in Colorado. The continuing
education hours must be selected from among the Core Competencies
below in any combination, except that, within every twenty-four month
period, a minimum of 4 continuing education hours must be related to
codes as defined in Board Rule 1.2 and a maximum of 2 hours can be
related to safety training:

(a) Cross connection and backflow prevention
(b) Fixtures, Faucets and Fixture Fittings
(c) Indirect/Special Waste

(d) Industry Product Training

(e) Non-potable Water Systems

(f) Plumbing Administration

(9) Residential Fire Sprinkler Systems

(h) Sanitary Drainage

(i) Special Piping (Medical Gas)

) Storm Drainage

(k) System piping and components

" Traps, Interceptors and Separators

{m) Vents - DVM

(n) Water Heaters

(o) Water Supply and Distribution

(p) Safety related to the plumbing industry.

Colorado Plumbing Code. In addition to the requirements of
1.4(E)3)(d)(1), licensees must make attestation upon renewal that they

have read the current Colorado Plumbing Code in Board Rule 1.2.

Continuing education credits wiil only apply to each twelve month period
after the later of the last date of renewal or reinstatement

Licensees shall cooperate with the Board to determine compliance with
continuing education requirements.

38



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR720-1

State Plumbing Board

(5)

The requirements stated in Board Rule 1.4(E)(3) shall apply to:

(a) All original plumbing licenses granted after July 1, 2021;

(b) All plumbing licenses upon completion of the 2021 renewal; and,
(c) All plumbers are subject to Board Rule

Pursuant to section 12-155-112(2)(c), C.R.S. continuing education

requirements within section 12-155-112(3)(a), C.R.S. do not apply to
water conditioning installers or water conditioning principles,

e. Attesting Providers. Continuing education providers must be listed with the Board
and attest that their courses and instructors meet the continuing education
requirements of Board Rule sections 1.4 (E)(3)(d)(1) through (4), The list of
Attesting Providers with expire on December 31st of the final year of the current
code cycle.

(1)
(2)

(3)

The Board has sole discretion to accept providers that have attested.

Providers. Providers may attest that they meet the CE requirements if
their courses and instructors meet all the requirements of Board Rule
1.4(E)(3)(e)(4).

(a) As proof of course completion, the Board will accept a certificate
of completion from the course provider.

(b) Certificates of completion shall not be issued to attendees unless
the course is successfully completed. Certificates of completion
shall include all of the following elements:

(i) Name of attendee;

(i) Attendee’s Colorado plumber’s license number;
(iii) Date of course;

(iv) Provider name and approval number,;

(v) Course title;

(vi) Instructor name; and

{vii) Number hours of continuing education credit earned.

Courses. Criteria for courses from Attesting Providers shall include the
following:

(a) Each course shall cover a minimum of one core competency, as
listed in Board Rule 1.4(E)}(3)(d){1). Course credit will apply to
only one core competency per course.

39



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR 7201

State Plumbing Board

(4)

()

(6)

(7)
(8)

(b) All online courses or webinars shall be interactive. Each course
must have capabilities in place to ensure active participation and
demonstrate comprehension a minimum of once per hour, and
fast-forward must be disabled.

Instructors. Courses must be taught by instructors with the following
qualifications:

(a) Instructors must be sponsored by the Attesting Provider.

(b) Instructor’s background and experience must meet at least one
of the following criteria.

(i) Hold a minimum of a Colorado master plumber’s license
or journeyman plumber’s license (or equivalent) plus a
minimum of five years of journeyman plumber field
experience;

(i) Community college or vo-tech instructor as approved by
the Board;

(iii) Plumbing continuing education instructor from other
areas as approved by the Board; or,

(iv) Instructor shall provide documentation of background
and experience as requested by the Board.

Once attesting they meet the qualifications as an Attesting Provider,
providers will be placed on an Attesting Provider list.

The Board has sole discretion to accept or reject any continuing
education credit earned by a licensee from a provider that is, or is not, on
the list.

The Board has discretion to remove providers from the list.

It is the responsibility of the licensee to ensure the continuing education
obtained meets the requirements of this section 1.4(3)(E).

Recordkeeping

(M

)
Audits

(1

)

The licensee shall track and document completed continuing education
in a process approved by the Board.

The licensee shall retain documentation for a minimum of six years.

The Board may conduct audits of continuing education for verification of
compliance with these requirements at any time. The Board may, at its
discretion, disallow any continuing education course completed by a
licensee that was offered by a provider on the Attesting Provider list.

A licensee shall provide all documentation requested for audit within
thirty days of the request.

40



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR720-1

State Plumbing Board

Muttiple Licenses. A licensee holding multiple licenses issued by the Board shall
complete continuing education requirements for the most advanced license held.
Completion of continuing education requirements for the most advanced license
shall satisfy the requirements for all lesser licenses.

4, Inactive License Status and Reactivation

a.

Inactive License. Pursuant to section 12-70-101, C.R.S., any licensee may apply
to the Board to transfer his or her license to inactive status. Such application
shall be in the form and manner designated by the Board. The holder of an
inactive license shall not be required to comply with continuing education
requirements for renewal so long the license remains inactive.

{1 Each holder of an inactive license shall renew once every two years with
the Board in the same manner as active license holders and pay a fee
pursuant to section 12-155-105(1)(d), C.R.S.

(2) During such time as a license remains in an inactive status, the licensee
shall not perform any acts restricted to active llcensed plumbers. Such
practice may be grounds for revocation.

Reactivation of Inactive License. An inactive license may be reactivated by
submitting the proper application, paying the current reactivation fee, and
meeting the appropriate requirements below.

(1) Inactive for Less Than Three Years. To reactivate a license that has
been inactive for less than three years, the applicant must provide
evidence of completion, within the three years immediately preceding the
application for reinstatement, of twenty-four hours of continuing
education, as defined in Board Rule 1.4(e)(3)

(2) Inactive for More Than Three Years. Pursuant to section 12-115-
110(4)(c), C.R.S., a licensee whose license has been inactive for more
than three years must demonstrate education to practice by any of the

following:
(a) Satisfactorily pass the state plumbing examination.
(b) Provide verification of an active license with a state where a

reciprocal agreement for an equivalent license exists.

(c) Provide verification of active licensure in a non- recuproca! state
as follows:

0 Verify an active residential plumber’s license,
journeyman plumber's license, or master plumber's
license in non-reciprocal state, respective to the license
you are reinstating;

(i) Evidence of completing twenty-four continuing education
hours pursuant to Board Rule 1.11(C) in the three years
immediately preceding the application for reinstatement;
and,

(iii) By other means approved by the Board.

41



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCRT720-1
State Plumbing Board

(3) Practicing with an Inactive License. Practicing plumbing work with a
license in inactive status shall constitute practice without an active
license and, therefore, may be grounds for injunctive or disciplinary
action, up to and including revocation.

5. Registered Plumbing and Water Conditioning Contractors with expired permits shall not
have their contractor registrations renewed until such time as all expired permits are
cleared or as otherwise allowed by the Board.

F. Pumping Equipment License

License required. Any individual licensed as a residential plumber, journeyman plumber, or
master plumber under Title 12, Article 155 of the Colorado Revised Statutes who intends to
install, alter, or repair “pumping equipment”, as defined by section 37-91-102(13), C.R.S., shall
first apply for and obtain licensure with the Water Well Construction and Pump Installation
Contractors Board prior to commencing any such activity. Failure to comply with the licensure
requirements set forth herein shall be, if proven, a violation of sections 12-155-113(1)(b) and 12-
20-404, CR.S.

(“Pumping equipment” means any pump or related equipment used or intended for use in
withdrawing or obtaining groundwater, including, but not limited to, well seals, pitless adapters,
and other safeguards to protect the groundwater from contamination and any waterlines up to
and including the pressure tank and any coupling appurtenant thereto.)

G. Requirement to Carry Documentation. Any licensed water conditioning registrant working as a
plumber, apprentice, or registered individual shall be required to carry on his or her person the
appropriate license, temporary work permit, or registration.

H. Residential Plumber on Commercial Job. Residential Plumbers must maintain an apprentice
registration when working on commercial jobs and be supervised accordingly.

I Plumbing Contractor's Loss of Responsible Master. A plumbing contractor that, for any
reason, loses the services of the responsible master plumber will be allowed twenty days in which
to hire another master plumber. If another master plumber has not been hired during that period,
the plumbing contractor registration will be placed into a “Need Master Hire-Cannot Practice”
status until such time as a master has been hired, and the appropriate fee paid.

J. Termination or Separation of Apprentice. Plumbing contractors shall notify the Board within
thirty days after the termination or separation of a plumbing apprentice.

K. Apprentice Information File. It shall be the responsibility of the apprentice to file and keep
current contact information with the Board. Notification by any manner approved by the Board is
acceptable but the online registration system is preferred.

L. Notice of Change of Address

1. A licensee or registrant shall inform the Board in a clear, explicit, and unambiguous
written statement of any name, address, telephone, or email change within thirty days of
the change. The Board will not change the licensee or registrant information without
explicit written notification from the licensee or registrant. Notification by any manner
approved by the Board is acceptable.

a. The Division of Professions and Occupations maintains one contact address for
each licensee or registrant, regardless of the number of licenses or registrations
the licensee or registrant may hoid.

42



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR720-1

State Plumbing Board
b. All communications will be sent to the address on record for each licensee or
registrant. Address change requests to route specific communications (i.e.,
confidential communications) to a separate address are not accepted.
2, The Board requires one of the following forms of documentation to change the name or

1.5

1.6

correct the social security number of a licensee or registrant:

a. Marriage license;

b. Divorce decree;

c. Court order; or

d. A driver’s license or social security card with a second form of identification may

be acceptable at the discretion of the Division of Professions and Occupations.

Advertising. Registered plumbing contractors or water conditioning contractors shall not
advertise in any manner by any name, including DBA's, other than the registered company name
on record with the Department of Regulatory Agencies.

EXAMINATIONS

Identification. The applicant shall present positive photo identification in order to be admitted to
the examination area.

Proprietary Information. The content and answers to examinations for licensure or renewal
administered by the Board are proprietary property. Licensees and registrants shall not disclose,
or offer to disclose any portion of the examinations to others. Licensees and registrants may be
subject to disciplinary action by the Board should they disclose, or offer to disclose, sell or
otherwise distribute the content and/or answers for any examinations administered by the Board.

Results. Examination results will be provided in writing to each examinee. Results will not be
given in any other manner. Consistent with widely accepted testing practices, applicants who
pass the examination will be given their results in a pass/fail format.

Review. Examinations shall not be subject to review by applicants.
PERMITS AND INSPECTIONS

Permits

1. Permit Required. A permit and inspections shall be required for all plumbing, fuel gas
piping work, water conditioning equipment installation or manufactured home hookup as
described in the Title 12, Article 155, C.R.S. and/or the Colorado Plumbing Code or
Colorado Fuel Gas Code, either through the Board or the Local Authority Having
Jurisdiction.

2. Issuance. Plumbing, fuel gas piping, water conditioning equipment or manufactured
home hookup permits shall be issued in the name of the qualified applicant or registered
contractor performing the work prior to the commencement of any work being
undertaken.

a. Qualified applicant. A qualified applicant able to purchase a permit for
inspection of a manufactured home hook up shall be a “registered installer” of
manufactured homes as defined by Part 33 of Article 32 of Title 24, C.R.S.

43



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR720-1
State Plumbing Board

Fraudulent Information. Any permit issued as a result of fraudulent or incorrect
information supplied on the application shall be cancelled.

4. Double Fee. Any work commencing prior to the purchase of a permit is subject to twice
the prescribed permit fee.

5. Stop Work Order
a. Notice to owner. Upon notice from the plumbing inspector that work on any

building or structure is being installed contrary to the provisions of this code or in
an unsafe and dangerous manner, such work shall be immediately stopped. The
stop work order shall be in writing and shall be given to the owner of the property
involved, or to the owner's agent or to the person doing the work, or posted at the
job site and shall state the conditions under which work will be permitted to
resume.

b. Unlawful continuance. Any person who shall continue any work in or about the
structure after having been served with a stop work order, except such work as
that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall
be subject to penalties as prescribed by this article.

6. Moved Buildings. Moved buildings with a pre-existing plumbing and/or fuel gas system
a. New potable water supply and sanitary system may be connected upon written

verification to the Board from a plumbing contractor that the existing system
presents no hazard to life, health, or property. A permit and inspection are
required to witness proper connections are made.

b. Prior to connecting an existing gas piping system to a new gas supply, a permit
must be obtained, a pressure test performed, and an inspection must be
approved.

C. Any new plumbing or gas piping system installed in a moved building shall
require a permit and inspections according to the codes and amendments
enforced at the time the permit is obtained.

7. Temporary Buildings. Temporary buildings used by the public shall incorporate sanitary
facilities and potable water in accordance with the Colorado Plumbing Code. Permits and
inspections are required.

B. Inspections

1. How Conducted. Inspections shall be conducted according to Section 107 (IPC, IFGC)
and Section P2503 (IRC) as adopted into the Colorado Plumbing Code or Colorado Fuel
Gas Code.

2. Requirements for inspections. Persons requesting inspections shall provide:

a. Access to the inspection area during the reasonable working hours (i.e., Monday
through Friday, 8:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m.),

b. Ladders for access to inspection areas such as roofs and/or deep crawl spaces.

c. An approved set of design plans for commercial and school jobs shall be located
at the job site.

44



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR 7201

State Plumbing Board

3. Inspection Categories. Prior to requesting an inspection, the installation to be inspected
shall be complete and under test by the following categories:

a. Plumbing

) Underground plumbing (all drain, waste, vent, and water piping below
grade).

(2) Rough in plumbing (all drain, waste, vent, and water piping, valves
above grade).

(3) Final plumbing (all plumbing fixtures installed with hot and cold running
water).

b. Gas piping

€))] Rough gas piping (all piping shall be installed and under the prescribed
air test).

(2) Underground installation (any underground piping after the point of
delivery by the purveyor).

(3) Final gas piping inspection (all gas appliance shutoff outlets shall be
installed, capped or plugged, unless connected to a properly vented gas
burning appliance).

4. Incomplete Installations. Installations that are incomplete when the inspector arrives

may be subject to a re-inspection fee.

Exception: Large projects may have partial inspections in designated areas as needed
to keep projects within a time schedule. All portions of the installation must be completed
within the designated area of inspection.

5. Reinspection Fees. A reinspection fee may be assessed at the discretion of the
inspector for reasons including, but not limited to, the following:

a.

The job is not ready for an inspection and an extra trip is required for the

inspector (a job with multiple code violations may be considered “not ready” by

the inspector).

Corrections have not been made to all code violations cited from previous
inspection.

No access to the job site for reasons including but not limited to; locked gate or
door, snow not plowed, no escort into an occupied structure, etc. (inspectors may
not enter an occupied residence without an escort at least eighteen years of age
or older).

Hazardous construction site as determined by the inspector or OSHA guidelines
(may include loose dogs, etc.)

Address not posted so as to be visible from the street or road.

Improper directions to jobsite given on permit or inspection requests.

45



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR720-1
State Plumbing Board

1.7

Reinspection. A reinspection shall not be performed until the reinspection fee has been
paid.

Requests. An inspection request will only be accepted from the permit owner or their
agent.

Provide services. A utility purveyor shall not provide service to any structure required to
have gas inspections required by section 12-155-120(1), C.R.S., without proof of
approval. Approval shall be indicated by the presence of a “Blue Tag” affixed to the gas
piping system at the point of utility connection. Approval may also be granted verbally or
in writing by the inspector or his/her supervisor.

ENFORCEMENT

Knowledge of Violation. Licensees and registrants having knowledge of, or involvement in, any
alleged violation of Title 12, Article 155, C.R.S., or Board Rules, shall cooperate with any

investigation initiated by the Board and furnish such information or assistance as may be
requested.

Reporting Felony Convictions

1.

Alicensee or registrant, as defined in sections 12-155-103(3), (4), (9), (10), and (13),
C.R.S,, including but not limited to registered plumbing apprentices, registered plumbing
contractors, or licensed plumbers (residential, journeyman, and master) shall inform the
Board, in a manner set forth in this Rule, within forty- five days of the conviction of the
licensee or registrant of a felony under the laws of any state or of the United States.

The conviction of the licensee or registrant of a felony under the laws of any state or of
the United States is grounds for discipline pursuant to section 12-155-113(1)(f), C.R.S.

For purposes of this Rule, a “conviction” includes:

a. A guilty verdict;
b. A plea of guilty accepted by the court; or
c. A plea of nolo contendere (no contest) accepted by the court.

The notice to the Board shall include the following information:

a. The court;

b. The jurisdiction;

c. The case name;

d. The case number; and

e. A description of the matter or a copy of the indictment or charges.

The licensee or registrant shall inform the Board of the following information within forty-
five days of each such occurrence:

a. The imposition of sentence for a felony conviction; and

46



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR 7201

State Plumbing Board
b. The completion of all terms of a sentence for a felony conviction.
6. The licensee or registrant notifying the Board may submit a written statement with any

7.

notice under this Rule to be included in the registrant or licensee records.

This Rule shall apply to any conviction or plea as described in Rule 1.7(B)(3).

C. Citations

1.

Forms. The citation form will be completed by the state plumbing inspector or by the
Board. Citations shall be served by certified mail, in person by a State plumbing
inspector, or by waiver of personal service. Personal service provided by the plumbing
inspector shall be verified by affidavit. The Program Director will approve the completed
and served citation. The Board maintains the discretion to dismiss the citation at any
time.

Response. The citation form shall direct the recipient to respond in one of the following
ways within ten working days after service of the citation:

a. Pay the fine;

b. Submit a written request to negotiate a stipulated settiement agreement with the
Program Director; or

c. Submit a written request for a formal administrative hearing.

Fines. If one of the following actions is not taken by the citation recipient within ten
working days following service of the citation, recipient will be deemed to have failed to
comply with the citation:

a. Full payment of the fine;
b. Written request for negotiation of a stipulated settlement agreement; or

C. Written request for a formal administrative hearing. Reasonable attorney fees
and costs may be assessed by the Board when taking formal action to collect
fines. A citation offense that is more than four years old will not be considered by
the Board when determining disciplinary action.

Negotiations. All requests and explanation for negotiation of a stipulated settlement
agreement shall be submitted to the Program Director or designee in writing and may
include information in mitigation of the violation. Inspectors shall not negotiate
settlements or accept payments of fines resulting from citations. The date the request for
negotiation of a stipulated settlement agreement is received by the Program Director
constitutes the submittal date. After reviewing the requested settlement information, the
Program Director has the option to authorize any of the following actions:

a. Reduce the fine;

b. Arrange a payment schedule for the fine:

C. Permit a personal appearance before the Board;
d. Refer the matter to the Board.

47



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR720-1
State Plumbing Board

5. Termination of negotiations. Negotiations may terminate for reasons including but not
limited to:
a. The recipient admits to committing the violation;
b. The recipient does not conduct settlement negotiations timely and in writing;
C. The recipient does not present reasonable mitigating or extenuating information
in writing;
d. The Program Director determines the settlement negotiations are not being

conducted in good faith or are being conducted for the purpose of delay;
e. it appears unlikely the parties will reach a negotiated resolution;

f. The recipient has prior violations that need to be brought to the Board's attention
prior to attempting settlement negotiations.

8. Stipulation Agreement. A stipulated settlement agreement shall be signed and dated by
the Program Director and the citation recipient. The stipulated settlement agreement shall
be approved by the Board to become final and shall contain an admission of the
violation{s), unless good cause exists, in the Program Director's discretion, to omit one or
more admissions. A stipulated settlement agreement shall be considered a violation for
the purpose of determining the fine amount of subsequent violations.

7. Formal Hearing. A written request from the citation recipient to proceed to a formal
hearing may be submitted at any time during settlement negotiations. If the negotiations
are subsequently deemed futile, the citation recipient shail be notified that payment of the
fine or request for a formal administrative hearing shall be submitted within ten calendar
days. Written settlement information may be used against the licensee, registrant, or
applicant respondent at the hearing when unsuccessful settlement negotiations proceed
to a formal administrative hearing.

8. Attorney General Assistance. The Board or Program Director may request that the
Attorney General assist with settlement negotiations when the citation recipient retains an
attorney for assistance during the stipulated settlement negotiations.

9. Hearings. Hearings shall be conducted by an administrative law judge at the Office of
Administrative Courts. The citation recipient may be represented at the hearing by
counsel of his or her choosing. Hearings shall be conducted in accordance with the
Administrative Procedure Act, Title 24, Article 4, C.R.S.

a. Board action. At the formal administrative hearing, the Board may pursue the
maximum fine allowed by statute. At the formal administrative hearing, the Board
may also pursue any other disciplinary sanctions such as revocation,
suspension, or probation.

48



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR 720-1
State Plumbing Board
D. The following is the current fine schedule adopted by the Board pursuant to section 12-155-
123(2), CR.S.
Violation Statutory/Rule 1st 2nd 3rd
Provision
Engaging in the business, trade, 12-155-108(1) Up to $2.000
or calling of a residential plumber 12-155-113(1)(a) $150 $375 P or da,
without a license 12-155-113(1)(0) perday
Engaging in the business, trade or 12-155-108(1) Up to $2.000
calling of a journeyman plumber 12-155-113(1)(a) $225 $600 P or de;
without a license 12-155-113(1)(0) peraay
Engaging in the business, trade or 12-155-108(1)
calling of a master plumber 12-155-113(1)(a) $300 seo0 | P 1082000
without a license 12-155-113(1)(0) perday
Engaging in the business, trade, )
or calling of a registered water 12-155-108(1) Up to $2,000
e 2 S ) . 12-155-113(1)(a) $150 $375
conditioning installer without being 12-155-113(1)(0) per day
registered by the Board
Engaging in the business, trade or
4 ; 12-155-108(1)
calling of.a registered water 12-155-113(1)(a) $205 $600 Up to $2,000
conditioning principal without 12-155-113(1)(0) per day
being registered by the Board
Engaging in the business, trade or 12-155-108(1) Up to $2,000
calling of a registered water 12-155-113(1)(a) $300 $600 P or da
conditioning contractor without 12-155-113(1)(0) P y
being registered by the Board
Failure of a plumbing contractor to 12-155-108(2)(b) $225 $600 Up to $2,000
register an apprentice 12-155-113(1)(a) per day
Failure of an apprentice to work 12-155-124(1) Up to $2,000
under the supervision of a $50 $200 Y
licensed plumber 12-155-113(1)(a) per day
Employment of unlicensed
personnel to perform piumbing 12-155-113(1)(k) $300 $600 Up;gr%i;gOO
work

49




CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR 720-1
State Plumbing Board
Violation Statutory/Rule 1st 2nd 3rd
Provision
Operating as a plumbing e
contractor without obtaining 1;21 ;251 11(3)?1()3()'.51) $750 $1,500 Up t§r$an,OOO
registration from the Board P y
Failure of a licensee to supervise 12-155-113(1)(i) $375 $600 Up to $2,000
a plumbing apprentice 12-155-124 per day
Supervision by a residential,
journeyman, or master plumber of 12-155-124(1) $375 $600 Up to $2,000
more than three apprentice 12-155-113(1)(a) per day
plumbers at the same jobsite
Failure to obtain a permit and/or 12-155-120(1) $375 $900 Up to $2,000
failure to obtain an inspection 12-155-113(1)(a) per day
Failure of a licensed or registered
individual working as a plumber to )
carry on his or her person the 12-155-113(1)(b) $150 $375 Up to $2,000
. : Rule 1.4(G) per day
appropriate license, temporary
work permit, or registration
Failure to remove a cause for
disapproval of any plumbing 4EE Up to $2,000
installation within a reasonable 12-155-113(1)(c) $450 $900 per day
time
Advertising by a licensee or
registrant which is false or 12-155-113(1)(g) $375 s750 | UP tgr%éooo
misleading P y
Deception, misrepresentation or
fraud in obtaining or attempting to |  12-155-113(1)(h) $1,000 $2,000 |YP tgr%éooo
obtain a license P y
Violating other state law in
connection with a construction
project (i.e., construction, safety, 12-155-108(3) $375 $750 Up to $2,000
labor, health, worker's 12-155-113(1)(q) per day

compensation insurance, or tax
law)

50




CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR 720-1
State Plumbing Board

Statutory/Rule

Violation .7,
Provision

1st 2nd 3rd

Other violations of Article 155 of 12-155-113(1) Upto Upto Up to $2,000
Title 12, C.R.S. or any Board Rule 4 $1,000 $2,000 per day

1.8

Compliance. Payment of a fine assessed from a citation does not relieve the receiver of the
citation from correcting the situation, installation, statute or code violation noted in the citation.

DECLARATORY ORDERS

Board Petition. Any person may petition the Board for a declaratory order to terminate
controversies or to remove uncertainties as to the applicability to the petitioner of any statutory
provision or of any Rule or order of the Board.

Board Ruling. The Board will determine, at its discretion and without notice to the petitioner,
whether to rule upon any such petition. If the Board determines that it will not rule upon such a

petition, the Board shall promptly notify the petitioner of its action and state the reasons for such
action.

Determination to Rule. In determining whether to rule upon a petition filed pursuant to this Rule,
the Board will consider the following matters, among others:

1. Whether a ruling on the petition will terminate a controversy or remove uncertainties as to
the applicability to petitioner of any statutory provision or rule or order of the Board.

2. Whether the petition involves any subject, question or issue which is the subject of a
formal or informal matter or investigation currently pending before the Board or a court
involving one or more of the petitioners.

3. Whether the petition involves any subject, question or issue which is the subject of a
formal or informal matter of investigation currently pending before the Board or a court
but not involving any petitioner.

4, Whether the petition seeks a ruling on a moot or hypothetical question or will result in an
advisory ruling or opinion.

5. Whether the petitioner has some other adequate legal remedy, other than an action for
declaratory relief pursuant to Rule 57, Colo. R. Civ. P., which will terminate the
controversy or remove any uncertainty as to the applicability to the petitioner of the
statute, rule or order in question.

Petition Requirements. Any petition filed pursuant to this Rule shall set forth the following:

1. The name, e-mail address, and physical address of the petitioner and whether the
petitioner is licensed pursuant to the organic act;

2. The statute, rule or order to which the petition relates:
3. A concise statement of all of the facts necessary to show the nature of the controversy or

uncertainty and the manner in which the statute, rule or order in question applies or
potentially applies to the petitioner.

51




CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR720-1
State Plumbing Board

E.

1.9

Procedure. If the Board determines that it will rule on the petition, the following procedures shall

apply:
1.

The Board may rule upon the petition based solely upon the facts presented in the
petition. In such a case:

a. Any ruling of the Board will apply only to the extent of the facts presented in the
petition and any amendment to the petition.

b. The Board may order the petitioner to file a written brief, memorandum or
statement of position.

c. The Board may set the petition, upon due notice to petitioner, for a non-
evidentiary hearing.

d. The Board may dispose of the petition on the sole basis of the matters set forth in
the petition.

e. The Board may request the petitioner to submit additional facts, in writing. In
such event, such additional facts will be considered as an amendment to the
petition.

f. The Board may take administrative notice of facts, pursuant to the Administrative

Procedure Act, section 24-4-105(8), C.R.S., and may utilize its experience,
technical competence and specialized knowledge in the disposition. If the Board
rules upon the petition without a hearing, it shall promptly notify the petitioner of
its decision.

The Board may, at its discretion, set the petition for hearing upon due notice to petitioner,
for the purpose of obtaining additional facts or information or to determine the truth of any
facts set forth in the petition or to hear oral argument on the petition. The notice to the
petitioner setting such hearing shall set forth, to the extent known, the factual or other
matters into which the Board intends to inquire. For the purpose of such a hearing, to the
extent necessary, the petitioner shall have the burden of proving all of the facts stated in
the petition, all of the facts necessary to show the nature of the controversy or uncertainty
and the manner in which the statute, rule or order in question applies or potentially
applies to the petitioner and any other facts the petitioner desires the Board to consider.

Parties. The parties to any proceeding pursuant to this Rule shall be the Board and the petitioner.

Any other person may seek leave of the Board to intervene in such a proceeding, and leave to

intervene will be granted at the sole discretion of the Board. A petition to intervene shall set forth
the same matters as required by section (D) of this Rule. Any reference to a “petitioner” in this
Rule also refers to any person who has been granted leave to intervene by the Board.

Order. Any declaratory order or other order disposing of a petition pursuant to this Rule shall
constitute agency action subject to judicial review pursuant to section 24-4-106, C.R.S.

STATE PLUMBING INSPECTORS

Applicant. All applicants for the position of state plumbing inspector must possess a current

journeyman or master plumber license issued by the State of Colorado.

Plumbing License. Plumbing inspectors must maintain a current Colorado journeyman or master
plumbing license.

52



CODE OF COLORADO REGULATIONS 3 CCR 720-1
State Plumbing Board

Editor’s Notes

History

Entire rule eff. 01/01/2008.

Entire rule eff. 04/01/2010.

Rules 2.3.A, 2.4.1-2.4.2, 6.4 eff. 09/01/2011.

Entire rule eff. 03/15/2014.

Rules 2.3, 3.1 eff. 12/15/2014.

Entire rule eff. 02/14/2016.

Rules 2.56.1.27,4.1,4.2,4.54,4.5.5,4.6-4.13, 6.1, 7.4 eff. 04/01/2016.

Rules 1.2A-C,1.2D.4,12D.7-10,1.2E, 1.3, 1.4 A, 1.4 E, 1.6 B.8 eff. 06/14/2020. Rule 1.4.D repealed
eff. 06/14/2020.

53





